
Bellevue City Council Meeting   +++Amended Agenda+++
Tuesday, May 4, 2021 6:00 PM
Bellevue City Hall
1500 Wall Street
Bellevue, NE 68005

1. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
2. INVOCATION - Father Tom Jones, Church of the Holy Spirit (Episcopal), 1305 Thomas Drive.
3. CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL
4. OPEN MEETINGS ACT - Posted in the Entry to the Council Chambers
5. APPROVAL OF AGENDA, CONSENT AGENDA, CLAIMS, AND ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
REPORTS: 

a. Approval of the Agenda
b. Approval of the Consent Agenda (Items marked with an (*) are approved where this 
item is, unless otherwise removed)

1. * Acknowledge Receipt of the April 16, 2021 Board of Health Meeting Minutes.
2. * Approval of the April 20, 2021 Board of Equalization  Meeting Minutes.
3. * Approval of the April 20, 2021 City Council Minutes.
4. *  Acknowledge Receipt of the April 22, 2021 Planning Commission Minutes.

6. * APPROVAL OF CLAIMS
7. SPECIAL PRESENTATIONS:  None
8. ORGANIZATIONAL MATTERS:  None
9. APPROVED CITIZEN COMMUNICATION:  None Received
10. LIQUOR LICENSES:

a. Recommend approval of a Special Designated Liquor License for Paul R. Klabunde dba 
"Century Lounge to sell beer, wine, and distilled spirits at a BBQ Kickoff, to be held at 2109 
Franklin Street, Bellevue, on June 6, 2021 from 8:00 a.m. to 12:00 a.m.  (City Clerk) 
b. Recommend approval of application for Sarah Norman Rowe as the new Manager for 
Midwest Catering and Events, LLC dba "Patricia's Catering" at 439 Galvin Road N., Bellevue.  
(City Clerk)

11. ORDINANCES FOR ADOPTION (3rd reading):
a. Ordinance No. 4030:  Amending Section 12-57 through 12-85, of the Municipal Code 
pertaining to Fireworks.  (City Clerk)
b. Ordinance No. 4031: Ordinance pertaining to Adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code.  
(Chief Building Inspector)
c. Ordinance No. 4032: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International Building 
Code, International Residential Code and the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code.  
(Chief Building Inspector)
d. Ordinance No. 4033: Ordinance pertaining to amendments of the 2021 International 
Residential Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
e. Ordinance No. 4034: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International 
Mechanical Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
f. Ordinance No. 4035: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 Uniform Plumbing 
Code; Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code and the 2021 International Fuel Gas 
Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
g. Ordinance No. 4036:  Request to rezone Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, 
being a replat of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, from AG and RE to RE and RG-
50, for the purpose of existing residential development.  Applicant:  DWS Land Surveying.  
General location:  9100 S 13th Street.  (Planning Manager) 

1. Approval of small subdivision plat Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2.  



2. Approval of waiver of Section 6-7 (8) of the Subdivision Regulations for flag lots. 
12. ORDINANCES FOR PUBLIC HEARING (2nd reading):
13. ORDINANCES FOR INTRODUCTION (1st reading):

a. Ordinance No. 4037:  An Ordinance to add new sections to Chapter 6 regarding leash and 
muzzle requirements for pit bull breeds, breed ambassadors, insurance, and the NHS annual 
reporting procedures.  (Councilman Burns)
b. +++  Item removed

14. PUBLIC HEARING ON MATTERS OTHER THAN ORDINANCES:
a. Request to final plat Lots 1 through 263 and Outlots A and D, Alta Collina, being a platting 
of the South 1/2 of the Northeast 1/4 of Section 7, T13, R13E of the 6th P.M., Sarpy County, 
Nebraska.  Applicant: Orchard Valley, LLC  General Location: 48th Street and Lookingglass 
Drive.  (Planning Manager)

1. Approval of the Alta Collina Subdivision Agreement
15. RESOLUTIONS:  None
16. CURRENT BUSINESS:  None
17. ADMINISTRATION REPORTS: Comments must be limited to items on the current 
Reports (Monthly reports are given at the first Council Meeting of every month - April report 
is attached.)
18. CLOSED SESSION:
19. ADJOURNMENT











 
 

Bellevue City Council Meeting, April 20, 2021, Page 1 
 

A regular meeting of the Mayor and Council of the City of Bellevue was called to order by Mayor  
Rusty Hike at the Bellevue City Hall on the 20th day of April, 2021, at 6:00 p.m.  Present were  
Council Members Bob Stinson, Paul Cook, Jerry McCaw, Don Preister, Thomas Burns, and Kathy Welch.  
 
Notice of this meeting was given in advance thereof by publication in the Gretna Guide, “Daily Record” and 
posting in two public places, the designated method for giving notice and was also given to the Mayor and 
all members of the City Council.  A copy of the affidavit of publication, the certificate of posting, and the 
council's acknowledgment of receipt of notice are hereby attached to these minutes.  All proceedings shown 
hereafter were taken while the convened meeting was open to the public. 
 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND INVOCATION  
 
Mayor Hike led the Pledge of Allegiance.  Pastor Joseph Gastineau, Revival Tabernacle Church, 2226 
Jefferson Street, Bellevue, gave the invocation.   
 
Mayor Hike announced to the audience if anyone is there for the pet ordinance, the first reading has been 
postponed to May 4th. 
 
OPEN MEETINGS ACT 
 
Mayor Hike announced a copy of the Open Meetings Act is posted by the entry in the City Council 
Chambers. 
 
APPROVAL OF THE AGENDA: 
 
Motion was made by Burns, seconded by Welch to approve the agenda.  
 
Motion was made by Cook, seconded by Preister, to amend the agenda by moving Item 16g. after Item 
10.  Roll call to approve the motion was as follows:  Stinson, Cook, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; 
voting no: none; absent:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
Roll call to approve the agenda as amended is as follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and 
Welch voted yes; voting no: none; absent:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
APPROVAL OF THE CONSENT AGENDA: 
 
Motion was made by Stinson, seconded by Burns, to approve the consent agenda, consisting of the 
following items:  Acknowledge Receipt of March 25, 2021 Planning Commission Minutes; Acknowledge 
Receipt of March 31, 2021 Board of Health Minutes; Approval of April 6, 2021 City Council Minutes; 
Acknowledge Receipt of March 3, 2021 Sidewalk Task Force Minutes; Acknowledge Receipt of March 9, 
2021 Tree Board Meeting Minutes; Approval of Claims; Recommend reappointment of John Perrin and 
Leland Jacobson to the Citizens Complete Street Advisory Panel, for a four-year term ending April 2025.  
 
Roll call vote on the motion was as follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; 
voting no: none; absent:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
SPECIAL PRESENTATIONS:   
Mayor Hike read the Proclamation declaring April 20, 2021 as "Arbor Day" in the City of Bellevue. 
(Councilman Preister) 
 
Members of the Tree Board were present to receive the proclamation.    
 
ORGANIZATIONAL MATTERS:  None 
 
APPROVED CITIZEN COMMUNICATION: None 
 
LIQUOR LICENSES:  None 
 
Recommendation to approve a Special Fireworks Application for Twisted Thunder Fireworks to 
provide a Special Fireworks Display for the Schankenberg wedding, at the View, 1102 Country Club 
Ct., on 05/21/21 at dusk for approximately 5 minutes.  (City Clerk) 
 
Council President Cook explained prior to the meeting he was advised the distributor for the fireworks 
display will be changing.  
 
Mr. Eric Schankenberg explained the wedding date has changed to May 15, 2021.  Due to the date change 
the fireworks vendor is changing to Midwest Fireworks.   
  
Motion was made by Cook, seconded by Welch, to approve a Special Fireworks Application for Midwest 
Fireworks to provide a Special Fireworks Display for the Schankenberg wedding, at the View, 1102 Country 
Club Ct., on 05/15/21 at dusk for approximately 5 minutes.  Roll call vote on motion to approve was as follows:  
Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
 



 
 

Bellevue City Council Meeting, April 20, 2021, Page 2 
 

 
 
ORDINANCES FOR ADOPTION (Third Reading):  
 
Ordinance No. 4029:  An ordinance to amend Article VI, Chapter 19, of the Bellevue Municipal Code by 
adding a new section 19-83 regarding prohibition of engine braking.   (Public Works Director) 
 
Ordinance No. 4029: An Ordinance to amend Article VI, Chapter 19, of the Bellevue Municipal Code by 
adding a new Section 19-83 regarding the prohibition of engine braking and to provide for an effective date 
was read for the third and final time.  
 
Motion was made by Welch, seconded by Stinson, to approve Ordinance No. 4029.  Roll call vote on the 
motion was as follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no: none; 
absent:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
ORDINANCES FOR PUBLIC HEARING (Second Reading): 
 
Ordinance No. 4036:  Request to rezone Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, being a replat 
of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, from AG and RE to RE and RG-50, for the purpose of 
existing residential development.  Applicant:  DWS Land Surveying.  General location:  9100 S 13th 
Street.  (Planning Manager)  
 
Ordinance No. 4036:  An Ordinance to amend the Official Zoning Map of the City of Bellevue, Nebraska, as 
provided for by Article 3 of Ordinance No. 3619 by changing the zone classification of land located at or about 
9100 South 13th Street, more particularly described in Section 1 of the Ordinance and to provide an effective 
date of this ordinance was read by title only for the second time and a public hearing was held.  
 
Approval of small subdivision plat Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2.  (No action taken at this 
meeting.) 
 
Approval of waiver of Section 6-7 (8) of the Subdivision Regulations for flag lots. (No action taken at this 
meeting.) 
 
Mayor Hike opened the meeting to a public hearing to give opportunity for individuals to speak in favor of 
or in opposition to the application.   
 
No one in the audience came forth to speak in support of or in opposition to the application.  Mayor Hike declared 
the public hearing closed.  
 
Mayor Hike stated the third and final reading of the ordinance will be heard at the Council meeting on May 4, 
2021.   
 
Ordinance No. 4030:  Amending Section 12-57 through 12-85 of the Municipal Code pertaining to 
Fireworks.  (City Clerk) 
 
Ordinance No. 4030:  An ordinance to amend Section 12-57 through 12-85, of the Bellevue Municipal Code 
pertaining to fireworks, to repeal all previous versions of the same; to provide for the publication of this ordinance 
in pamphlet form; and to provide an effective date of this ordinance was read by title only for the second and a 
public hearing was held. 
 
Mayor Hike opened the meeting to a public hearing to give opportunity for individuals to speak in favor of 
or in opposition to the ordinance.   
 
Mr. Blake James, 1812 Hancock Street, questioned why Bellevue does not allow fireworks to be sold in tents but 
in temporary building structures.   
 
No one in the audience came forth to speak in support of or in opposition to the application.  Mayor Hike declared 
the public hearing closed.  
 
Mayor Hike advised he will have the fire department review this item.    
 
Ms. Robbins commented she will talk to Chief Guido and have information at the next meeting for the Council. 
 
Mayor Hike stated the third and final reading of the ordinance will be heard at the Council meeting on May 4, 
2021.   
 
Ordinance No. 4031: Ordinance pertaining to Adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code.  (Chief Building 
Inspector) 
 
Ordinance No. 4031:  An Ordinance to amend Sections 12-2, 12-36 through 12-36.1 and 12-170 of the Bellevue 
Municipal Code pertaining to the Bellevue Fire Prevention Code; to repeal Sections 12-2, 12-36 through 12-36.1 
and 12-170 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore existing; to provide for the publication of this ordinance in 
pamphlet form; and to provide for the effective date of this ordinance was read by title only for the second time 
and a public hearing was held.  
 



 
 

Bellevue City Council Meeting, April 20, 2021, Page 3 
 

Mayor Hike opened the meeting to a public hearing to give opportunity for individuals to speak in favor of 
or in opposition to the application.   
 
No one in the audience came forth to speak in support of or in opposition to the application.  Mayor Hike declared 
the public hearing closed.  
 
Mayor Hike stated the third and final reading of the ordinance will be heard at the Council meeting on May 4, 
2021.   
 
Ordinance No. 4032: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International Building Code, 
International Residential Code and the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code.  (Chief Building 
Inspector) 
 
Ordinance No. 4032:  An Ordinance to amend Sections 8-16 through 8-18 of Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City Code 
by adopting the 2021 Edition of the International Building Code with amendments and changes; to repeal Sections 
8-16 through 8-18 of Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore existing; to provide for the publication of 
this ordinance in pamphlet form; and to provide for the effective date of this ordinance was read by title only for 
the second time and a public hearing was held.  
 
Mayor Hike opened the meeting to a public hearing to give opportunity for individuals to speak in favor of 
or in opposition to the application.   
 
Mr. Leon Komar, 5712 Rees Street, Omaha, Nebraska addressed concerns with certain changes and 
modifications to the 2018 IECC energy code.  He mentioned the changes will impact the health, safety and 
energy code for new homeowners and occupants in the Bellevue area.  He advised the city currently 
enforces the 2009 IECC and is looking at updating to 2021 IECC.  Bellevue is many years behind updating 
the International Codes.  If Bellevue doesn’t change now, it may be a long time before they consider it 
again. Mr. Koma mentioned he has great concern with the amendment completely deleting a mandatory 
requirement for building air leakage or blower door testing.  Further discussion ensued.    
 
Ms. Jaylene Eilenstine, 2637 S. 158th Plaza, Executive Director of Metro Omaha Builders Association 
(MOBO, spoke in support of Ordinance No. 4032 and the adoption of the 2021 IRC with proposed 
amendments.  
 
Mr. Denny Van Moorleghem, 3758 South 184th Avenue, Omaha, advised he is a builder and developer of 
several subdivisions in Bellevue.  He spoke in support of the proposed ordinance and amendments to the 
IRC code.  
 
Mr. Marc Stadola, 3803 N. 153rd Street, Charleston Homes, spoke in support of the proposed ordinance 
and adoption of the 2021 IRC code.  He advised these codes are written for safety issues and to benefit 
the homeowner.  
 
Mr. Jerry Standerford, 14711 Industrial Road, Omaha, Sherwood Homes, advised he has served on the 
IRC review committee since 2000.  He advised originally when the IRC code was presented, it was 
presented the code would be amended at the local level.   The mandate is still the same.  Countless hours 
have been spent reviewing the amendments to the code.  Mr. Standerford provided a description of what a 
REScheck is and advised how the REScheck works.  Further discussion ensued.   
 
No one in the audience came forth to speak in support of or in opposition to the application.  Mayor Hike declared 
the public hearing closed.  
 
Mayor Hike questioned Mr. Mike Christensen, Chief Building Official, when a blower door test is taken on a house. 
Mr. Christensen replied at the end when the house is final.  
 
Mr. Christensen mentioned the City of Bellevue did extensive research to try to be compatible to other 
jurisdictions.  There is a program put in place to ensure homes are energy sufficient.  The City of Bellevue goes 
out through the home building process to check the REScheck process.   He advised it is redundant to do a 
blower test.  Conversation ensued.  
 
Councilman Preister mentioned the code is straight forward.  He questioned why all the other codes are 2021 
and the energy code is 2018.  Mr. Christensen explained the city has to be equivalent to the state.  The National 
Home Builders Association have been unhappy with some of the proposals in the 2021 codes and there have 
been some lawsuit. Since there have been so many issues on the 2021 energy codes, he decided to match up 
with what the state the state has.  
 
Councilman Preister mentioned the codes apply to new construction.  He requested clarification if the codes 
would also apply to remodeling or additions of existing structures.  Mr. Christensen replied yes, any new additions 
would need to adhere to the International Energy Conservation Code and building codes. 
 
Councilman Preister initiated conversation on having a blower door test done in his personal home.   He does not 
understand why the builders have an issue with the blower test.  Mr. Christensen commented costs keep going 
up.  Every dollar counts.  The blower test may be a great investment for an older home.  The newer homes do go 
through RESchecks as well as a REScheck inspection.  
 
 



 
 

Bellevue City Council Meeting, April 20, 2021, Page 4 
 

Councilman Preister requested clarification on the four options of ventilation. Mr. Christensen replied there are 
two options.  Mr. Christensen explained the difference in the two options.   
 
Councilwoman Welch requested clarification that the city has an energy inspector who would create the instance, 
where a blower door test is not required.  Mr. Christensen stated the city has an inspector to do a physical 
insulation inspection and REScheck.  The REScheck is a component which allows the builders to meet the energy 
conservation code.  Conversation ensued.  
 
Councilman Preister initiated conversation on the basement wall R value is 13 inches. Discussion followed.   
 
Mayor Hike stated the third and final reading of the ordinance will be heard at the Council meeting on 
May 4, 2021.   
 
Councilman Preister questioned Mr. Komar on his response to the blower door component.  Mr. Komar proceeded 
to answer Councilman Preister’s question. 
  
Ordinance No. 4033: Ordinance pertaining to amendments of the 2021 International Residential 
Code.  (Chief Building Inspector) 
 
Ordinance No. 4033:  An Ordinance to amend Section 8-18.6 of Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City Code pertaining 
to the amendments and changes to the International Residential Code, 2021 Edition, to repeal Section 8-18.6 of 
Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore existing, to provide for the publication of this ordinance in 
pamphlet form; and to provide for the effective date of this ordinance was read by title only for the second time 
and a public hearing was held.    
 
Mayor Hike opened the meeting to a public hearing to give opportunity for individuals to speak in favor of 
or in opposition to the application.   
 
Ms. Bree Robbins advised Mr. Christensen provided an amendment which will be presented at third reading.   Ms. 
Robbins advised she wanted to read the amendment for the public hearing.  The amendment is to add a new 
Section R908.7 Roof Maintenance/Repair as follows: “No roofing permit is required for any maintenance or repairs 
that are an accumulative of one roofing square (100’ sq) or less provided there is only one layer of existing roof 
covering.  Any reroofing exceeding one roofing square (100’ sq) requires a permit and the entire roof to be brought 
up to current code”. 
 
No one in the audience came forth to speak in support of or in opposition to the application.  Mayor Hike declared 
the public hearing closed.  
 
Mayor Hike stated the third and final reading of the ordinance will be heard at the Council meeting on May 4, 
2021.   
 
Ordinance No. 4034: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International Mechanical 
Code.  (Chief Building Inspector) 
 
Ordinance No. 4034:  An Ordinance to amend Sections 27-196 through 27-196.1 of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue 
City Code by adopting the 2021 Edition of the International Mechanical Code; to repeal Sections 27-196 through 
27-196.1 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore existing; to provide for the publication of this ordinance in 
pamphlet form; and to provide for the effective date of this ordinance was read by title only for the second time 
and a public hearing was held.    
 
Mayor Hike opened the meeting to a public hearing to give opportunity for individuals to speak in favor of 
or in opposition to the application.   
 
No one in the audience came forth to speak in support of or in opposition to the application.  Mayor Hike declared 
the public hearing closed.  
 
Mayor Hike stated the third and final reading of the ordinance will be heard at the Council meeting on May 4, 
2021.   
 
Ordinance No. 4035: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 Uniform Plumbing Code; 
Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code and the 2021 International Fuel Gas Code.  (Chief 
Building Inspector) 
 
Ordinance No. 4035:  An Ordinance to amend Sections 27-85 through 27-87 of Chapter 27 of The Bellevue City 
Code by adopting the 2021 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code; to amend Section 27-85.1 of the Bellevue City 
Code by adopting the 2021 Edition of the International Fuel Gas Code, to amend Section 27-86 of the Bellevue 
City Code by adopting the 2021 Edition of the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa, and Hot Tub Code; to amend Section 
27-87 of the Bellevue City Code pertaining to the amendments and changes to the newly adopted codes; to 
repeal Sections 27-85 through 27-87 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore existing; to provide for the 
publication of this ordinance in pamphlet form; and to provide for the effective date of this ordinance was read by 
title only for the second time and a public hearing was held.   
 
Mayor Hike opened the meeting to a public hearing to give opportunity for individuals to speak in favor of 
or in opposition to the application.   
 



 
 

Bellevue City Council Meeting, April 20, 2021, Page 5 
 

 
No one in the audience came forth to speak in support of or in opposition to the application.  Mayor Hike declared 
the public hearing closed.  
 
Mayor Hike stated the third and final reading of the ordinance will be heard at the Council meeting on May 4, 
2021.    
 
ORDINANCES FOR INTRODUCTION: (First Reading):  None 
 
 
PUBLIC HEARINGS ON MATTERS OTHER THAN ORDINANCES:  None 
 
RESOLUTIONS:  
 
Resolution No. 2021-11:  A resolution ratifying all actions taken by the City Council during virtual 
meetings.  (Legal) 
 
Motion was made by Welch, seconded by Preister, to approve Resolution No. 2021-11:  A resolution 
ratifying all actions taken by the City Council during virtual meetings.  Roll call vote on motion to approve 
was as follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  none.  Motion 
carried. 
 
CURRENT BUSINESS:   
 
Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the CDBG-CV Round 3 Subrecipient Agreement with the 
Bellevue Public School Foundation for the COVID-19 PPE Emergency Assistance, in an amount not 
to exceed $8,904.00. (CDBG Program Specialist / Finance Director) 
 
Motion was made by Cook, seconded by Burns, to approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the CDBG-CV 
Round 3 Subrecipient Agreement with the Bellevue Public School Foundation for the COVID-19 
PPE Emergency Assistance, in an amount not to exceed $8,904.00.  Roll call vote on motion to approve was as 
follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the CDBG-CV Round 3 Subrecipient Agreement with All 
Communities Outreach Services for the COVID-19 Companionship and Outreach Assistance, in an 
amount not to exceed $29,907.00. (CDBG Program Specialist / Finance Director) 
 
Motion was made by Stinson, seconded by Preister, to approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the CDBG-CV 
Round 3 Subrecipient Agreement with All Communities Outreach Services for the COVID-19 Companionship 
and Outreach Assistance, in an amount not to exceed $29,907.00.  Roll call vote on motion to approve was as 
follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
Approve & authorize the Mayor to sign the agreement with DIY Holding Company, LLC for the 2021 
Concrete Pavement Rehab Project, in an amount not to exceed $396,818.00, plus a 10% contingency 
of $39,681.80, for a total project cost of $436,499.80.  (Public Works Director) 
 
Motion was made by Preister, seconded by Cook, to approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the agreement 
with DIY Holding Company, LLC for the 2021 Concrete Pavement Rehab Project, in an amount not to exceed 
$396,818.00, plus a 10% contingency of $39,681.80, for a total project cost of $436,499.80.  Roll call vote on 
motion to approve was as follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  
none.  Motion carried. 
 
Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Professional Engineering Services Agreement with 
Jacobs Engineering Group Inc. for the seven sites in the Storm Drainage Improvement Project, in 
an amount not to exceed $241,757.00. (Public Works Director)  
 
Motion was made by Burns, seconded by Welch, to approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Professional 
Engineering Services Agreement with Jacobs Engineering Group Inc. for the seven sites in the Storm Drainage 
Improvement Project, in an amount not to exceed $241,757.00.  Roll call vote on motion to approve was as 
follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Professional Services Agreement with Alfred Benesch & 
Company for the Municipal Separate Storm Sewer System (MS4) Annual Reporting, in an amount not to 
exceed $17,880.00. (Public Works Director) 
 
Motion was made by McCaw, seconded by Burns, to approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Professional 
Services Agreement with Alfred Benesch & Company for the Municipal Separate Storm Sewer System (MS4) 
Annual Reporting, in an amount not to exceed $17,880.00.  Roll call vote on motion to approve was as follows:  
Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
 
 
 



 
 

Bellevue City Council Meeting, April 20, 2021, Page 6 
 

 
Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Lease Agreement Addendum with the DMV located at 
14402 Harlan Lewis Road, extending the terms for one year with an expiration date of April 30, 
2022.  (City Administrator) 
 
Motion was made by Cook, seconded by Welch, to approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Lease 
Agreement Addendum with the DMV located at 14402 Harlan Lewis Road, extending the terms for one year 
with an expiration date of April 30, 2022.  Roll call vote on motion to approve was as follows:  Stinson, Cook, 
McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Purchase and Sale Agreement conveying 13407 
Spencer Circle, which city acquired upon annexation, to Aimee and Brant Hill, in the amount of 
$32,000.00.  (Administration) 
 
Motion was made by McCaw, seconded by Cook, to approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Purchase 
and Sale Agreement conveying 13407 Spencer Circle, which city acquired upon annexation, to Aimee and 
Brant Hill, in the amount of $32,000.00.  Roll call vote on motion to approve was as follows:  Stinson, Cook, 
McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch voted yes; voting no:  none.  Motion carried. 
 
ADMINISTRATION REPORTS: Comments must be limited to items on the current Reports (Monthly 
reports are given at the first Council Meeting of every month - March report will be attached to the 
April 6th Council packet). 
 
CLOSED SESSION:  None 
 
ADJOURNMENT: 
 
There being no further business to come before the Council at this time, on motion by Preister, seconded 
by McCaw, the meeting was adjourned at 7:20 p.m.  
 
Roll call vote on motion to approve was as follows:  Stinson, Cook, McCaw, Preister, Burns, and Welch 
voted yes; voting no:  none; Absent: none.  Motion carried.         
 
 
 
 
 
              
Susan Kluthe, City Clerk     Rusty Hike, Mayor   

 
 
I, the undersigned, City Clerk of the City of Bellevue, Nebraska, hereby certify that the foregoing is a true 
and correct copy of proceedings had and done by the Mayor and Council on  April 20, 2021; that all of the 
subjects included in the foregoing proceedings were contained in the agenda for the meeting, kept 
continually current and readily available for public inspection at the office of the City Clerk; that such 
subjects were contained in said agendas for at least twenty-four hours prior to said meeting; that at least 
one copy of all reproducible material discussed at the meeting was available at the meeting for examination 
and copying by members of the public; that the said minutes were in written form and available for public 
inspection within ten working days and prior to the next convened meeting of said body; that all news media 
requesting notification concerning meetings of said body were provided advance notification of the time and 
place of said meeting and the subjects to be discussed at said meeting. 
 
 
        
       ______________________________________ 
       Susan Kluthe, City Clerk 



*5b4.  
4/20/2021



















































ORDINANCE NO. 4030

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTION 12-57 THROUGH 12-85, OF THE 
BELLEVUE MUNICIPAL CODE PERTAINING TO FIREWORKS, TO REPEAL ALL 
PREVIOUS VERSIONS OF THE SAME; AND TO PROVIDE AN EFFECTIVE DATE OF 
THIS ORDINANCE. 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
BELLEVUE, NEBRASKA: 

Section 1.  That Sections 12-57 through 12-85 of the Bellevue Municipal Code are hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

§ 12-57 DEFINITIONS.

(A)   For the purposes of this article, the words CONSUMER FIREWORKS shall mean only 
sparklers, Vesuvius fountains, spray fountains, torches, color fire cones, star and comet-type color 
aerial shells without explosive charge for the purpose of making noise, lady fingers, not to exceed 
seven eights (7/8) of an inch in length or one-eighth (1/8) inch in diameter, total pyrotechnic 
composition not to exceed one-half (1/2) grain in each weight, color wheels and any other 
fireworks approved under the provisions of Neb. RS § 28-1241(6)(a) as may be amended.

(B)   The term FLYING LANTERNS shall mean any device that requires a flame which produces 
heated air trapped in a balloon-type covering allowing the device to float in the air. FLYING 
LANTERNS shall not include hot-air balloons used for transporting persons. 

§ 12-58 EXCEPTION.

The provisions of this article shall not apply to the discharge of any fireworks for purposes or 
under the auspices of any governmental subdivision.

§ 12-59 FIREWORKS RESTRICTED.

No person shall possess, sell, offer for sale, bring into the City or discharge any flying lanterns or 
pyrotechnics, commonly known as fireworks, other than permissible fireworks. No person shall 
discharge any flying lanterns or fireworks within an area less than 100 feet from any structure used 
for the exhibition or sale of fireworks.

§ 12-60 SALE, DISTRIBUTION, STORAGE AND DISCHARGE OF FIREWORKS 
RESTRICTED; DEFINITIONS.

(A)   No person shall sell, hold for sale, offer for sale, or distribute or deliver fireworks in the City 
as a distributor, jobber or retailer (as such terms are defined by the laws of the State, as amended 
from time to time) unless licensed by the City for such purposes; provided that such licensee shall 
at all times comply with sections 12-60 through 12-100 and with any applicable laws, regulations 
and rules of the State, as amended from time to time.

 (B)(1)   No fireworks may be sold at retail in this City except, daily, from 8:00 a.m. until 10:00 
p.m., June 25 through July 3, and from 8:00 a.m. until 12:00 midnight on July 4. Unless first 
expressly approved by the city council, it shall be unlawful for any person to discharge any other 
pyrotechnics or pyrotechnic devices in this City other than fireworks. Unless first expressly 
approved by the City Council, it shall be unlawful to discharge fireworks in this City except 
between:
         (a)   8:00 a.m. to 10:00 p.m. on any day from June 25 through July 3,
         (b)   8:00 a.m. to 12:00 midnight on July 4, and
         (c)   9:00 p.m. on December 31 to 12:30 a.m. on January 1.

      (2)   All retail fireworks sales sites shall prominently display a sign listing the days and hours 
for legal discharge of fireworks in the City of Bellevue and that any debris caused by the discharge 
of fireworks in the City must be disposed of by the user. Nothing in this article shall be construed 



to permit the discharge or other use of any fireworks or any other pyrotechnics or pyrotechnic 
devices in violation of any other law of this City or the State of Nebraska.

(C)   No person other than distributors or jobbers or retailers licensed by the City shall store 
fireworks for retail sale, distribution or delivery in this City. No such storage shall be permitted 
except between the hours of 8:00 a.m. on June 23 through 12:00 noon on July 7 Such storage shall 
be allowed only on sites approved for the retail sale of fireworks pursuant to the provisions of 
section 12-77 in facilities complying with all applicable provisions of law.
 
(D)   Unless the context shall otherwise require, whenever used in sections 12-60 through 12-100, 
the term:

(1)   COMMUNITY BETTERMENT shall mean a purpose which generally betters or 
enhances the community of the City of Bellevue, including:
         (a)   The acquisition, improvement and maintenance of parks and recreational facilities, 
public equipment and other items for community use;
         (b)   The recruitment and attraction of new businesses and jobs to the City of Bellevue;
         (c)   Athletic programs which serve the city or neighborhoods or other areas of the 
community;
         (d)   Scholarships and youth programs; and
         (e)   Other acquisitions, services or programs which generally benefit the city and its 
residents.
     
      (3)   FIREWORKS shall mean and include only those fireworks that are permitted for sale by 
a retailer under the laws of the state, as amended from time to time.
      (4)   FLYING LANTERNS shall mean any device that requires a flame which produces 
heated air trapped in a balloon-type covering allowing the device to float in the air. Flying lanterns 
shall not include hot-air balloons used for transporting persons.
   (E)   Notwithstanding any other provisions in this section, the possession, use, discharge, retail 
sale, offer for retail sale, or explosion of flying lanterns in this city is prohibited.

§ 12-61 LOCATION AND MAKE-UP OF FIREWORKS RETAIL OUTLETS.

   (A)   No fireworks shall be sold or exhibited except from a sales outlet meeting the requirements 
of this code. All such sales outlets and all facilities used to store fireworks shall be located and set 
back at least:
      (1)   25 feet from the nearest right-of-way line of any public right-of-way,
      (2)   100 feet from any residential structure, and
      (3)   50 feet from any other structure.
   (B)   All sales outlets shall consist of a temporary building structure (which shall not include any 
tent or structure with canvas or cloth-like roofs) that either has a booth or stand that allows patrons 
to view and purchase fireworks from the outside of such structure or that allows patrons to enter 
such structure to view and purchase fireworks; provided, however, no such structure shall enclose 
floor space exceeding 1,250 square feet nor be located within 20 feet of any facility used to store 
fireworks.
   (C)   All sales outlets enclosing any area intended to be used by patrons in connection with the 
sale of fireworks shall have a minimum of three doors for patrons, each at least three feet in width 
and located as remotely as practical from any other door or entryway. Each door shall be able to 
be opened in the direction of egress. All sales outlets enclosing any other area to be used by any 
person other than a patron shall have a minimum of one door at least three feet in width that is able 
to be opened in the direction of egress.
   (D)   The floor area enclosed by any sales outlet shall be earthen, steel, asphalt or concrete, in all 
instances free of any vegetation in excess of three inches in height and all flammable or 
combustible materials.

§ 12-62 PROXIMITY TO CERTAIN BUSINESSES AND HAZARDS.

   (A)   No sales outlet and no facility used to store fireworks shall be located within: (i) 100 feet 
from:



      (1)   Any facility or structure used for the sale, above ground storage or dispensing of any 
liquefied petroleum gases or any other combustible fuel, including diesel fuel, gasoline or propane; 
or
      (2)   Any container used in connection with any liquefied petroleum gases; provided, further, 
that no organization holding a retail license for sales of fireworks shall permit any motor vehicle 
to park within 15 feet of the exterior of any fireworks sales outlet or facility used to store fireworks. 
Such distance shall be measured from the closest point where such motor vehicle may be situated 
or any hazard or material may be located or is dispensed, vented, or stored above ground.
   (B)   No vegetation (in excess of three inches in height), flammable or combustible materials 
shall be allowed within ten feet from the exterior of any sales outlet or any facility used to store 
fireworks.

§ 12-63 SCREENING.

   All windows, entryways and other openings on any sales outlet shall be covered by a screen, 
with squares or openings in the screen not more than one-quarter inch across; provided a sales 
outlet that allows for outside sales may have up to one foot of the space immediately above the 
sales counter area unscreened for the transaction of business. Screens shall be securely fastened to 
the sales outlet to prevent any gaps between the screen and the sales outlet.

§ 12-64 FIRE EXTINGUISHER.

   At least one multipurpose fire extinguisher shall be furnished and maintained with a current 
annual inspection tag in all areas used for the sale and storage of fireworks. The extinguisher shall 
have a rating of at least 4-A for Class A fires. Two stored pressure water extinguishers with a 
capacity of at least 2-1/2 gallons each may be substituted for multipurpose extinguishers. The 
travel distance to any extinguisher required by this section shall not exceed 25 feet. At least one 
person shall be present at the sales outlet during all business hours who has been trained, and is 
able, to operate the fire extinguishing equipment. Such person shall be required to demonstrate 
such ability whenever requested by the fire department.

§ 12-65 ELECTRICAL SERVICE.

   (A)   Any electrical service used in any sales outlet shall comply with all provisions of the 
National Electrical Code, as then currently adopted by the city.
   (B)   Any extension cord used in, for or to any sales outlet or fireworks storage facility shall be 
designated as “heavy-duty” and shall have conductors of at least 14AWG and shall be protected 
from vehicle and pedestrian traffic at all times.
   (C)   No electrical cord shall be used in, for or to any sales outlet or fireworks storage facility in 
a manner that would increase the potential for fire or electric shock.
   (D)   Any portable generator used to supply power to any sales outlet or fireworks storage facility 
shall be placed at least ten feet from the sales outlet and storage facility.
   (E)   Generators and/or fuel supplies shall not be stored in any sales outlet or any fireworks 
storage facility.

§§ 12-66—12-75 RESERVED.

§ 12-76 LIMITED ISSUANCE OF RETAIL FIREWORKS LICENSES.

   The City of Bellevue finds that there has been a proliferation of outlets for the sale of fireworks 
within the City and that such proliferation has placed an unacceptable burden on the fire marshal, 
the Bellevue Police Department, and other City departments in regulating the businesses. In 
addition, an increased use of fireworks within the City limits and surrounding areas has caused 
additional safety concerns. Therefore, licenses for the retail sale of fireworks may be issued to no 
more than 25 not-for-profit charitable, community or civic benevolent organizations which operate 
on a not-for-profit and benevolent basis within the City and meet the criteria set forth in this code.



§ 12-77 CITY CLERK TO ISSUE RETAIL LICENSES; APPLICATION FOR LICENSE.

 (A)   The City Clerk shall issue a single license to permit the sale of fireworks at retail to those 
duly organized and existing not-for-profit and benevolent organizations or associations meeting 
the criteria set forth in section 12-77(C) whose application has been approved for such purposes 
by the City Administrator. No person issued a retailer’s license shall be authorized to purchase, 
sell, store, hold for sale, offer for sale, or accept delivery of any fireworks other than fireworks 
sold or distributed by a jobber or distributor that has been licensed by the City for such purposes.

(B)   No application of any organization shall be approved by the City Administrator and no license 
to sell fireworks as a retailer shall be issued except to an organization that:
      (1)   Is a duly organized not-for-profit and benevolent organization or association that has been 
operating or doing business on a not-for-profit and benevolent basis within the City for at least one 
year prior to April 1 of the year in which the application required by this section is submitted and 
has actually conducted or engaged in community betterment activity during such period;
      (2)   Has been licensed by the State of Nebraska as a retailer; and
      (3)   Has made application for such license required by section 12-77(E).

(C)   Notwithstanding any other provision of this code, no organization shall be eligible to receive 
a City retailer’s license for the license year following any license year during which the 
organization:
      (1)   Failed to satisfactorily evidence the payment of all sales taxes applicable to the sales of 
fireworks by the organization for such license year or otherwise failed to comply with section 12-
64, 12-65, 12-85; or
      (2)   Had a City retailer’s license revoked by the City. Thereafter, an organization that was 
ineligible to receive a City retailer’s license by application of section 12-77(C)(1) shall remain 
ineligible until such organization has paid the applicable sales tax for the deficient license year and 
has otherwise satisfactorily complied with section 12-64, 12-65, 12-85 for non-compliant license 
year to the extent possible.

(D)   Application for a retailer’s license shall be made to the City Clerk between April 1 and April 
30 of each year; provided that in the event such date shall fall on a weekend or a day that is a 
holiday recognized by the City, such application shall be submitted no later than the close of 
business on the first business day of the City following such date. The City Clerk shall promptly 
forward each application to the City Administrator. No application shall be accepted unless the 
full application and supporting documentation is completed and submitted to the City Clerk at the 
time of submission. Applications shall only be supplemented if allowed by the City Administrator 
and only for good cause shown. Examples of good cause shall include, but not be limited to, 
information that is an applicant is waiting on from the State Fire Marshal, bond approval, or other 
state requirement that may be delayed. The application and any supplemental information shall be 
maintained in the office of the City Clerk.

(E)   Application shall be made on a form provided by the City Clerk for such purposes and shall 
include the following:
      (1)   The identity, address and telephone number of a contact person for the organization, 
together with a copy of the retailer’s license issued by the State to the organization.
      (2)   To the extent that the organization is required by law to register its existence or make 
some other filing in order to be authorized to lawfully operate or to conduct business in the State 
of Nebraska and/or the City, a certified copy from such appropriate governmental body or agency 
showing that at the time of the application the organization is existing, validly organized, in good 
standing and certified to do business or operate in the State of Nebraska; provided, however, that 
to the extent the organization is not so required (e.g., lodges, social, civic, fraternal and beneficial 
entities authorized under Neb. RS § 21-608), the organization shall include such information as 
may be necessary or appropriate to evidence to the City that it is validly organized, in good 
standing and able to do business in the City;
      (3)   Documentation evidencing that the organization is currently operating as a not-for-profit 
and benevolent organization or association within the City and otherwise meet the eligibility 
requirements set forth in section 12-77(B)(1);
      (4)    A verified statement identifying (by name and state license number) all distributors or 
jobbers with whom such organization will do business as a retailer during the year of application 



if the license is issued, with appropriate documentation from the distributor or jobber supporting 
such statement; 
      (5)    Documentation evidencing the organization’s due payment of all sales taxes applicable 
to the sales of fireworks by the organization in the preceding year;
      (6)    A verified statement that, as a condition of the license, the organization:
         (a)   Agrees to purchase fireworks only from those distributors or jobbers that are identified 
in the statement submitted pursuant to section 12-77(E)(4) to whom a license for such purposes 
has been issued by the City;

         (b)    Agrees to comply with and abide by all provisions of this code, including any directive 
from the City in respect to this code or to the laws, rules or regulations of the State;
         (c)    Agrees to sell fireworks only from a single sales outlet meeting the requirement of this 
code at the approved location identified in its application by address or other suitable area 
description;
         
         (d)    Understands that any such license issued to the organization is personal to the 
organization and the organization agrees that it will not assign or transfer or attempt to assign or 
transfer the license in any manner; and
         (e)    Understands and agrees that the City is authorized and entitled, in its discretion, to 
revoke or suspend the organization’s City retail license (and upon demand the organization shall 
immediately surrender its license to the city and cease selling any fireworks) upon the occurrence 
of any act, error or omission of the organization (including any of its members, officers, directors 
or agents) that results in:
            1.   A violation of any of the agreements or understandings set forth in this subsection 12-
77(E)(6);
            2.   A violation of the laws, rules or regulation of the State pertaining to the sale or storing 
of fireworks that may, or does, result in the revocation or suspension of its State retailers license; 
or
            3.   A violation of sections 12-60 through 12-100 that constitutes an immediate threat, in 
the opinion of the fire inspector, to public health, safety or welfare;
      (8)   A verified statement that the organization understands that, in addition to the eligibility criteria 
otherwise set forth in this code, as a condition of being permitted to apply for a license, the organization 
shall:
         (a)   Have made the timely payment of all applicable sales and other taxes resulting from the retail 
sale of fireworks, including any related reporting obligations, under any similar license issued by the City 
in the preceding year; and
         (b)   Have made a timely and true and correct filing of any statement required by section 12-85.
      (10)   Any other information request on such form as may be appropriate in order that the City 
may ascertain that the organization shall have complied with any applicable provisions of this 
code;
      
(F)   In any year, if more than 25duly completed applications from eligible organizations are 
received by the City Clerk and have been approved by the City Administrator, then the City Clerk 
shall issue licenses from among such approved organizations as follows:
      (1)   Those organizations that were issued a similar license by the City in the immediately 
preceding license year shall be issued a license;
      (2)   In the event that after expiration of the appeal time as outlined in section (G) below for all 
organizations whose applications were not approved by the City Administrator (other than by 
application of section 12-77(B) or 12-77(C)), there are less than 25 organizations that have been 
issued a license by application of 12-77(F)(1), and there remain organizations whose applications 
were approved by the City Administrator, the City Clerk shall issue licenses to a number of 
approved organizations equal to a number that when added to the total of licenses issued for that 
year pursuant to section 12-77(F)(1) does not exceed 25 provided that the organization who 
received a license in the preceding year and whose appeal has been successful shall be accorded 
the same priority as if approved by the City Administrator. The organization to be issued a license 
pursuant to section 12-77(F)(2) shall be determined by lot in a manner the City Administrator finds 
to be appropriate.

(G)   The City Administrator shall approve or deny all the applications of all organizations by no 
later than the second Monday in May in the year of the application. Any denial shall be made in 



writing personally delivered or sent by regular mail addressed to the person designated in the 
application specifying the reasons for the denial. Any denial may be appealed to the City Council 
by written notice made to the City Administrator within ten (10) calendar days of the date of the 
denial; provided, however, no appeal shall be permitted because denial was the result of the 
application of sections 12-77(B) or 12-77(C) and no appeal shall be allowed to any organization 
denied a license by the application of section 12-77(F)(2). The city administrator shall schedule a 
hearing before the city council at the next available and regularly scheduled city council meeting 
that is at least five business days after receipt of such notice of appeal.

(H)   Whenever an organization has been approved by the City Administrator or by a successful 
appeal to the City Council, no license shall be issued.
      (1)   Unless the organization shall first:
         (a)   Pay the City a license fee in the amount stated in the Master Fee Schedule in cash or by 
check representing then good funds;
         (b)   Furnish the bond required by section 12-79;
         (c)   File a copy of its State retail license with the City Clerk; and
      (2)   The inspection contemplated by section 12-81 has been successfully completed.

§ 12-78 RESERVED.

§ 12-79 BOND.

   (A)   No license may be issued to an organization for the retail sale of fireworks, unless the 
organization shall first furnish to the City a cash bond in the amount of $1,000.00.
   (B)   Such bond shall be conditioned so that:
      (1)   The organization shall abide by any laws and regulations pertaining to the sale of 
fireworks, including all applicable provisions of sections 12-60 through 12-100, and
      (2)   That the organization shall thoroughly clean the location identified in its application where 
fireworks are to be stored or sold and remove any outlet, stand, booth or other facility and all debris 
from such location by 12:00 noon on July 7 of each year, unless July 7th falls on a weekend, then 
clean-up shall be completed by 12:00 noon on the following Monday.
   (C)   The bond shall be forfeited to the City in its entirety whenever the license issued to the 
organization is revoked by the City for any reason contemplated by section 12-77(E)(6) or 
whenever the organization shall not comply with the condition set forth in section 12-79(B)(2).

§ 12-80 LICENSING OF DISTRIBUTORS AND JOBBERS; FEES AND TAXES; 
REVOCATION OF LICENSE.

   (A)   No person shall sell, hold for sale, offer for sale, or distribute or deliver fireworks in the 
City as a distributor or jobber unless such person is licensed as a distributor or jobber by the State 
of Nebraska and the City. No person shall be licensed as a distributor or jobber by the City unless 
such person shall register its State license with the City on a form provided by the City Clerk for 
such purposes on or before April 1 in the calendar year in which such activity is to be conducted 
and shall first pay the license fee imposed by section 12-80(D); provided however the registration 
shall not be permitted to any distributor or jobber (including any affiliate, subsidiary or other 
organization that is, directly or indirectly, owned, operated or controlled by any such distributor 
or jobber or by any person or individual owning, operating or controlling such distributor or jobber) 
if a jobber’s or distributor’s license previously issued by the City has been revoked.

(B)   In the event such date shall fall on a weekend or a day that is a holiday recognized by the 
City, registration shall be made by no later than the close of business on the first business day of 
the City following such date.

(C)   A City jobber’s or distributor’s license shall be valid only for the calendar year during which 
the State license is issued and the registration is made.

(D)   Registration shall be made on a form provided by the City Clerk for such purposes and shall 
include:



   

      (1)   Identification of the license number and the pertinent nature of the license issued by the 
State, and
      (2)   All other information requested by the City as may be appropriate in order that the City 
may ascertain that such distributor or jobber is in compliance with the applicable provisions of this 
code; provided that such information shall be considered the confidential proprietary information 
of the organization and of the applicant/distributor/jobber and not subject to disclosure to the extent 
permitted by law. Such registration shall be accompanied by payment, by certified check, of a 
license fee in the amount stated in the Master Fee Schedule.

(E)   Nothing in this section 12-80 shall be construed to permit any distributor or jobber to engage 
in the sale of fireworks at retail unless such distributor or jobber has been licensed for such sales 
in accordance with the provisions of section 12-77.

(F)   All information submitted by any distributor or jobber pursuant to this section 12-80 shall be 
maintained and made available in the City Clerk’s office.

(G)   Any license issued pursuant to this section 12-80 shall not be construed to allow such 
distributor or jobber to sell, purchase or distribute any fireworks except to those distributors, 
jobbers and retailers licensed by the City for such activities.

(H)   Each distributor’s or jobber’s license issued by the City shall be subject to immediate 
revocation or suspension by the City whenever the distributor or jobber shall sell, purchase or 
distribute fireworks to or from any retailer, jobber or distributor that is not appropriately licensed 
by the City at the time of the purchase, sale or distribution.

§ 12-81 INSPECTION REQUIRED; DUTY OF LICENSEE.

(A)   No retail license may be issued to an organization whose application has been approved for 
the retail sale of fireworks, unless an inspection conducted by the fire inspector and any other 
appropriate inspector of the City of its sales outlet and storage facilities has determined the 
organization’s conformity to and compliance with the code, including any land use regulations.

(B)   The organization shall request the City in writing addressed to the City Clerk no later than 
4:00 p.m. on June 23 of the appropriate calendar year to make such inspection. The City shall 
attempt to conduct such inspection within 24 hours after the request has been made. The 
inspector(s) shall advise the City Clerk at such time as the inspection has determined that such 
organization is in compliance with the requirements of the code.

(C)   Nothing in this shall preclude the City from subsequently revoking, suspending or demanding 
the surrender of the organization’s retail license.

§ 12-82 DISPLAY OF RETAIL LICENSE.
 
Any retail license issued by the City shall be prominently displayed at all times at the sales outlet.

§ 12-83 DURATION.

   Any retail license issued by the City shall be valid only for the calendar year in which issued.

§ 12-84 AGE OF SELLERS AND PURCHASERS.

(A)   Any person actually selling or offering for sale any fireworks in the City shall be at least 14 
years of age, and no licensee shall allow or permit any person to sell or offer to sell any fireworks 
who is not 14 years of age, provided however that someone over the age of 16 shall be present at 
all times.



(B)   No person actually selling or offering for sale any fireworks in the City shall sell or offer to 
sell fireworks to any person who is under 16 years of age, and no licensee shall allow or permit 
any person to sell or offer to sell any fireworks to any person who is under 16 years of age.

§ 12-85 STATEMENT OF PROFITS AND EXPENSES.

(A)   Each organization that has received a retail license pursuant to section 12-77 shall file with 
the City Clerk on or before September 30, a detailed verified statement providing the following 
information:
      
      (1) The total dollar amount paid by all patrons for fireworks at the sales outlet during the license 
period, including, separately stated, the amount of sales tax collected by the organization and to 
be paid in connection with such sales, including the manner and means of calculating the same; 
and
   
      (2)   Such other information as the City shall consider appropriate.

(B)   Such statement shall be filed on a form that the City Clerk has prepared for such purposes.

(C) The form shall be maintained and made available in the office of the City Clerk.

§ 12-86 VIOLATIONS.

   Any person or any licensee who violates any of the provisions of sections 12-59, 12-60, 12-61, 
12-64,12-82 or 12-84 shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor in addition to any fine or penalty 
for such violation as may otherwise be provided in sections 12-60 through 12-100.

§§ 12-87—12-100 RESERVED.





















                                                               ORDINANCE NO 4031

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTIONS 12-2, 12-36 THROUGH 12-36.1 AND 12-170 OF 
THE BELLEVUE MUNICIPAL CODE PERTAINING TO THE BELLEVUE FIRE PREVENTION 
CODE; TO REPEAL SECTIONS 12-2, 12-36 THROUGH 12-36.1 AND 12-170 OF THE BELLEVUE 
CITY CODE AS HERETOFORE EXISTING; TO PROVIDE FOR THE PUBLICATION OF THIS 
ORDINANCE IN PAMPHLET FORM; AND TO PROVIDE FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS 
ORDINANCE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
BELLEVUE, NEBRASKA.

Section 1. That Section 12-2 of the Bellevue Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 12-2. Fire Hydrants generally

(a) No building shall be erected within the city limits and within the extra-territorial zoning 
jurisdiction of the city, unless it shall be protected by sufficient approved type fire hydrants in 
accordance with Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies and Appendix B Fire Flow Required 
for Buildings of the 2021 International Fire Code.

(b)  Where compliance with this section requires the installation of private hydrants, such 
hydrants will be installed at the expense of the property owner requiring such hydrants. These 
hydrants shall be served by a minimum of a 6-inch main and shall be certified, inspected, flow 
tested, and maintained by the Metropolitan Utilities District.

(c) All fire hydrant systems shall meet the approval of the fire department as to installation 
and location. Plans and specifications shall be submitted to the fire department for review and 
approval prior to construction.

(d) Building construction or storage areas shall not be started prior to the hydrant system being 
placed in service.

Section 2. That Section 12-36 of the Bellevue Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as 
follows:

Sec. 12-36. Adoption of International Fire Code

There is hereby adopted by the city of Bellevue, Nebraska, for the purpose of prescribing 
regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or explosion, that certain 
code known as the 2021 International Fire Code, being particular the edition in use the year of 
which shall correspond with the same year of the building code being currently used by the City of 
Bellevue, including appendices, of which code not less than three (3) copies have been and are now 
filed in the office of the Fire Marshal, and the same is hereby adopted and incorporated as fully set 
out at length herein; provided that whenever any provision shall conflict with the provisions of the 
City Code, or any other City ordinance, the provision of the City Code or other such ordinance 
shall govern.

Section 3. That Section 12-36.1 of the Bellevue Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as 
follows:

Sec. 12-36.1 Amendments and changes to code adopted in Sec 12-36 adoption of International Fire 
Code.

(A) The International Fire Code, 2021 Edition, is amended and changed in the following 
respects:

(1) Amend Section 308.1.4 Open flame cooking devices. By deleting exception 2 
and by changing exception 3 to read as follows:



Exceptions:

2. LP-gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not 
greater than 20 pounds.

(2) Amend Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Change “20 feet” to “24 feet”.

(3) Delete Section 503.2.7 Grade, and substitute the following language:

“The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be a maximum of 10%”

(4) Delete Section 507.5.3 (1) and substitute the following language:

Private fire hydrants (all types) shall be certified, inspected, flow tested, and 
maintained by the Metropolitan Utilities District.

(5) Section 609.1 General. Insert “and NFPA 96”

(6) Section 903.2.8 Group R. Add Exception to read as follows.

Exception: Sprinkler systems are not required in R-3 One- and two-family 
dwellings, or Townhouses that are separated into separate buildings by a common 
two (2) hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM 
E 119 or UL 263. Such walls shall not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, 
ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire 
exposure from both sides and shall extend to and be tight against exterior walls 
and the underside of the roof sheathing. Electrical, cable and telephone 
installations are permitted, but shall be installed in accordance with the adopted 
electrical code in Chapter 10 of the Bellevue City Code. Penetrations of electrical 
boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4 2012 IRC.   

 (7) Amend Section 3405.1 Individual piles. Add new first sentence, “These 
regulations shall apply to outdoor storage of tires where fifty (50) or more tires are 
stored”. Change “5,000 square feet (464.5 M2)” to “2,500 square feet (232.3 M2)” 
and change “50,000 cubic feet (1416 M3)” to “25,000 cubic feet (707.92 M3)”. 
Add, “A maximum of two tire piles may be established on a single site”.

 (8) Delete Section 3405.6

 (9) Add Section 3405.8 Bond. Add as a new Section to read as follows:

Bond. As a condition of the issuance or continuation of any permit authorizing 
the outdoor storage of tires, the applicant or permittee shall file with the city clerk 
a bond in favor of the City, with good and sufficient surety, in the amount of 
$20,000. This bond shall be conditioned that the applicant or permittee, as 
principal, shall faithfully perform all of the requirements imposed upon the outdoor 
tire storage operation by federal, state, and local law; and shall perform such 
cleanup, moving or removal of tires as is required by federal, state or local law. 
This section shall apply immediately to all applications or renewal requests 
submitted after the effective date of this Section.

Holders of permits as of the effective date of this Section shall file the required 
bond within 90 days of the effective date of this Section.

Once every two (2) years after the effective date of this Section, the City shall 
inspect all sites licensed under this Section. If such an inspection finds that the fair 
and reasonable cost to lawfully remove and dispose of all tires stored on the site 
exceeds $20,000, then the amount of the required bond for that site shall be 
immediately increased to equal that cost. In such case, the license holder shall be 
so notified, and shall provide the required bond within thirty (30) days. Nothing in 
this Section shall be construed to permit the storage of a volume of tires in excess 
of that which is otherwise allowed by law.

(10) Amend Section 3407.1 Where required.  To read as follows:



Where required.  A firmly anchored fence or other approved method of security 
that controls unauthorized access to the storage yard shall surround the storage 
yard.

(11) Amend Section 3407.2 Construction. Change “6 feet (1829mm) high” to “10 feet 
(2048mm high)”.

(12) Amend Section 3504.2.1 When required. Change “30 minutes” to “2 hours” and 
change “extend” to “modify”

(13) Amend Section 5601.1.3 Fireworks.

Delete Exceptions 1 and 2 and renumber 3 and 4.

(14) Amend Appendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads: Change all 20 feet widths 
to 24 feet widths.

(B) The following Reference Standards for this Fire Code are amended as follows: 

(1)  Change “ICCEC- 21 ICC Electrical Code” to “Electrical Code: The electrical code 
for this jurisdiction shall be as adopted by Chapter 10 of the Bellevue Municipal 
Code and all codes adopted therein”

(2) Change “IBC- 21 International Building Code” to Building Code: The building 
code for the jurisdiction shall be as adopted by Chapter 8 of the Bellevue Municipal 
Code and all codes adopted therein”.

(3) Delete “IEBC- 21 International Existing Building Code”.

(4) Change “IFGC- 21 International Fuel Gas Code” to “Fuel Gas Code: The fuel gas 
code for this jurisdiction shall be as adopted in Chapter 27 to the Bellevue 
Municipal Code”.

(5) Change “IMC- 21 International Mechanical Code” to “Mechanical Code: The 
mechanical code for this jurisdiction shall be as adopted by Chapter 27 of the 
Bellevue Municipal Code”.

(6) Change “IPC- 21 International Plumbing Code” to “Plumbing Code: The plumbing 
code for this jurisdiction shall be as adopted by Chapter 27 of the Bellevue 
Municipal Code”.

(7) Change “IRC- 21 International Residential Code” to “International Residential 
Code: The International Residential Code shall be as adopted by Chapter 8 of the 
Bellevue Municipal Code”.

(8) Delete. “IUWIC-21 International Urban-Wildlife Interface Code”.

Section 4. That Sections 12-170 of the Bellevue Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec.12-170. Signs

All signs shall meet the requirements of the 2021 International Fire Code, Appendix D. If there is 
a curb along the fire lane, the curb shall be painted red.

Section 5. That Sections 12-2, 12-36 through 12-36.1 and 12-170 of Chapter1 of the Bellevue City 
Code as heretofore existing are hereby repealed.

Section 6. This Ordinance shall be published in pamphlet form.

Section 7. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval and 
publication as provided by law.

Passed and approved this ____day of ________________, 2021.



                                                                                               ____________________________       
                                                                          Mayor

Attest:

__________________________
City Clerk

First Reading April 6, 2021                                      APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Second Reading April 20, 2021                                __________________________________
                                                                                             City Attorney
Third reading May 4, 2021





                                                                 ORDINANCE NO. 4032

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTIONS 8-16 THROUGH 8-18 OF CHAPTER 8 OF THE 
BELLEVUE CITY CODE BY ADOPTING THE 2021 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
BUILDING CODE WITH AMENDMENTS AND CHANGES; TO REPEAL SECTIONS 8-16 
THROUGH 8-18 OF CHAPTER 8 OF THE BELLEVUE CITY CODE AS HERETOFORE EXISTING; 
TO PROVIDE FOR THE PUBLICATION OF THIS ORDINANCE IN PAMPHLET FORM; AND TO 
PROVIDE FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BELLEVUE, 
NEBRASKA:

Section 1. Section 8-16 through 8-18 of Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to 
read as follows:

§ Sec. 8-16 STATE BUILDING CODE ADOPTED.

(A) By this reference there is hereby created the State Building Code as such code is 
identified by Neb. RS § 71-6403, Reissue of 2019 Cum. Supp.

(1) The International Building Code (IBC), chapter 13 of the 2009 2018 Edition, 
and all but such chapter of the 2018 edition, published by the International Code 
Council, except that (i) section 305.2.3 applies to a care facility for twelve or 
fewer persons;

(2) The International Residential Code (IRC), chapter 11 of the 2009 2018 Edition, 
and all but such chapter of the 2018 edition except section R313, published by 
the International Code Council; 

(3) The International Existing Building Code, 2009 2018 Edition, published by the 
International Code Council.

(B) Notwithstanding any provision in section 8-16 (A), in the event that any provision in the 
state building code shall conflict with this chapter, any other provision of the Bellevue City 
Code, or any other applicable ordinances adopted by the City of Bellevue, the applicable 
provision of the Bellevue City Code or ordinance shall prevail.

(C) The foregoing matters are made a part of the Bellevue City Code as though fully set out 
herein; provided, however, that three copies of each such code shall be separately 
maintained on file in the office of the Permits and Inspections Department and shall remain 
there for public use and inspection.

Sec. 8-17. Building codes adopted.

(A) The following codes are hereby adopted and shall be considered the building codes for the 
City:

(1) The International Building Code, 2021 Edition, Chapters 2-29, 35, inclusive;

(2) Appendix C, Group U-Agricultural Buildings; E, Supplemental Accessibility 
Requirements; Appendix F, Rodent Proofing; Appendix G, Flood Resistant 
Construction; Appendix I, Patio Covers and Appendix J, Grading, of the 
International Building Code, 2021 Edition;

(3) The International Residential Code, 2021 Edition, Chapters 2-24 inclusive: and 
Chapter 44;

(4) Appendix AJ Existing Buildings and Structures.

(5) Appendix AK “Sound Transmission”, of the International Residential Code, 2021 
Edition;

(6) The International Energy Conservation Code, 2018 Edition;



(B) The following chapters are specifically excluded and shall not be considered as part of the 
building code for the city:

(1) Appendix Chapters A, B, H, K, L, M, N and O of the International Building Code, 
2021 Edition; 

(C) The 2021 International Residential Code shall apply to the construction, alteration, 
enlargement, replacement or repair of detached one (1) and two (2) family dwellings and 
their accessory structures, and any new construction required as a result of moving a one 
(1) or two (2) family dwelling. The 2012 International Building Code shall apply to the 
construction, alteration, enlargement, replacement or repair of all other buildings and 
structures, and any new construction required as a result of moving any other building.

(D) Sections of these codes that are modified amended or deleted elsewhere in this article. 
Three (3) copies of the International Building Code 2021 Edition, the International 
Residential Code 2021 Edition, and the International Energy Conservation Code 2018 
Edition, are to be retained on file with the Permits and Inspections Division and shall there 
remain for public use and inspection. These codes shall be in effect within the limits of the 
city and its two-mile zoning “jurisdiction”.

Section 2. That Section 8-18 of Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to read as 
follows:

Sec. 8-18. Amendments and changes to codes adopted in Section 8-17.

(A) The 2021 International Building Code is hereby amended, altered, modified and changed 
in the following respects:

(1) Amend Section 202, Definitions, by adding the following definitions:

ELECTRICAL CODE: The electrical code for this jurisdiction shall be Chapter 10 
of the Bellevue City Code.

FIRE CODE: The fire code for this jurisdiction shall be Chapter 12 of the Bellevue 
City Code and all codes adopted therein.

FUEL GAS CODE: The fuel gas code for this jurisdiction shall be the International 
Fuel Gas Code.

ICC ELECTRICAL CODE: Wherever reference is made to the ICC Electrical 
Code it shall mean “Electrical Code”. See definition for “Electrical Code”.

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE: Whenever reference is made to the 
International Fire Code it shall mean “Fire Code”.

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE: Whenever reference is made to the 
International Mechanical Code. it shall mean “Mechanical Code” See definition 
for “Mechanical code.

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE: Wherever reference is made to the 
International Plumbing Code it shall mean “Plumbing Code”. See definition for 
“Plumbing Code”.

MECHANICAL CODE: The mechanical code for this jurisdiction shall be Article 
VII Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code.

PLUMBING CODE: The plumbing code for this jurisdiction shall be Article IV 
Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code.



(2) Section 1502.5 Rain water. Add a new section as follow:

When roofs are sloped to drain over the edge, scuppers or gutters and down spouts, 
adequately sized, pitched, and supported, shall be installed to conduct rain water 
to ground level. Rain water shall be discharged at least three (3) feet away from 
the building foundation in a direction parallel to the adjoining property line when 
the discharge point is within twenty (20) feet of the adjoining property line.

Exception: Structures with no sub-grade spaces.

(3) Section 1807.1.4 Permanent Wood Foundation Systems.

Delete this section in its entirety.

(4) Section 1809.12 Timber footings.

Delete this section in its entirety.

(5) Section 1809.5 Frost protection. Delete this section and the exceptions in their 
entirety and replace with:

Except where erected on solid rock or otherwise protected from frost, foundation 
walls, piers, and other permanent supports of buildings and structures larger than 
seven hundred fifty (750) square feet in area or ten (10) feet in height shall extend 
below the established frost line. The established frost line shall be 42 inches below 
the exterior grade of the structure.

Exceptions:

1. The bottom surface of footings for unattached garages and accessory 
structures of wood or metal not more than seven hundred fifty (750) square feet in 
area shall not be less than one (1) foot below grade.

2. The bottom surface of foundations that bear on rock surfaces is not 
required to be below the established frost line provided the rock does not have 
seams or cracks or contain disintegrated material that could serve as reservoirs for 
water which could be subject to freezing.

(7) Chapter 29, Plumbing Systems. Delete this chapter in its entirety and change 
to read as follows:

Plumbing systems shall be installed in accordance with Chapter 27 of the Bellevue 
City Code.

(B) The 2018 International Energy Conservation Code is hereby amended, altered, modified 
and changed in the following respects:

(1) Amend Section R303.3 Maintenance information, by deleting the second and 
third sentences from this section.

(2) Amend Table R402.1.2, by changing climate zone 5 and Marine 4 – Basement 
Wall R-value to read as follows:

13

(3) Section R402.4.1.2 testing:

Delete this section in its entirety.

(4) Amend Section R403.3.3 Duct Testing (mandatory), by adding exception 3 to 
read as follows: 

Exception 3. A duct air-leakage test shall not be required for ducts that are sprayed 
with closed cell foam.



(5) Amend Section R403.3.5 Building Cavities (mandatory), by adding an 
exception as follows:

Exception: Interior building cavities may be used as ducts or plenums for return 
air when completely panned and sealed.

(6) Amend Section R403.5.1.1 Circulation systems to read as follows:

Heated water circulation systems shall be provided with a circulation pump. The 
system return pipe shall be a dedicated return pipe or a cold-water supply pipe. 
Gravity and thermosyphon circulation systems shall be prohibited. Controls for 
circulation hot water system pumps shall start the pump based on the identification 
of a demand for hot water within the occupancy. The controls may automatically 
turn off the pump when the water in the circulation loop is at the desired 
temperature and when there is no demand for hot water.

(7) Amend Section R403.6 Mechanical ventilation (Mandatory), to read as 
follows: 

When buildings and dwelling units are provided with mechanical ventilation it 
shall meet the requirements of Section M1505 of the International Residential 
Code or with other approved means of ventilation. Outdoor air intakes and 
exhausts shall have automatic or gravity dampers that close when the ventilation 
system is not operating. 

(8) Delete Section R403.8 Systems serving multiple dwelling units in its entirety.

Section 3. That Sections 8-16, 8-17 and 8-18 of Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore 
existing are hereby repealed.

Section 4. This Ordinance shall be published in pamphlet form.

Section 5. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval and 
publication as provided by law.

Passed and approved this ____day of ________________, 2021.

                                                                                               ____________________________       
                                                                          Mayor

Attest:

__________________________
City Clerk

First Reading April 6, 2021                                        APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Second Reading April 20, 2021                                __________________________________
                                                                                             City Attorney
Third reading May 4, 2021





                                                                  ORDINANCE NO. 4033

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTION 8-18.6 OF CHAPTER 8 OF THE BELLEVUE 
CITY CODE PERTAINING TO THE AMENDMENTS AND CHANGES TO THE 
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2021 EDITION; TO REPEAL SECTION 8-18.6 OF 
CHAPTER 8 OF THE BELLEVUE CITY CODE AS HERETOFORE EXISTING; TO PROVIDE 
FOR THE PUBLICATION OF THIS ORDINANCE IN PAMPHLET FORM; AND TO PROVIDE 
FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE.

BE IT ORDANIED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
BELLEVUE, NEBRASKA:

Section 1. That Section 8-18.6 of Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City code is hereby amended to 
provide as follows:

Sec. 8-18.6. Amendments and changes to the International Residential Code, 2021 
Edition.

(A) The International Residential Code, 2021 Edition, is amended and changed in the 
following respects:

(1) Amend Section R202 Definitions, by adding the following definition:

Sleeping Room. Any room in the house that is greater than seventy (70) square 
feet, has a built-in closet space and typically could be used as a bedroom. This 
does not include rooms used for cooking, eating, family living or gathering 
and excludes bathrooms, toilet rooms, halls, storage, utility and workshop 
space and all unconditioned space.

                (2) Amend Table R301.2 Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria, by adding 
the following:

Table R301.2 Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria
                  SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM  Ground

WIND 
SPEED SEISMIC 

DESIGN
WINTER 
DESIGN

FLOOD 
H A Z A R D S
'

ICE 
BARRIER AIR FREEZING INDEX

MEAN 
ANNUAL

TEMP
    SNOW    (mph)   C A T E G O R Y

   Weathering   Frost Line   Termi te       Decay
    TEMP'      REQ'D         TEMP

    LOAD

      A  Severe   42" M-H S-M    -3   1971   YES        1680    51.2
°

   25   115

                                                  MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA
     
Elevation

   Altitude
   Correction
  

  Coincident
  Wet bulb

Indoor winter
design 
temperature dry

Indoor winter design
 dry – bulb temperature

Outdoor
Winter dry 
design
temperature

Heating 
temperature
difference

        1,033        N/A   77% Humidity                     70 F         1 F            69 F
    Latitude Daily range Indoor summer 

design humidity 
Indoor summer Indoor summer design 

temperature
Outdoor summer 
design 
temperature

Cooling 
temperature 
difference

41.1543623        50%            75 F        91 F             16 F

(3) Amend Table R301.5 Minimum Uniformly Distributed Live Load, by 
changing the number “30” (live load for sleeping rooms) and replacing it with the 
number “40”

(4) Amend Section: R302.2 Townhouses. To read as follows:

Each townhouse shall be considered a separate building and shall be separated by 
a common two (2) hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance 
with ASTM E 119 or UL 263. Such walls shall not contain plumbing or mechanical 
equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated 
for fire exposure from both sides and shall extend to and be tight against exterior 
walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. Electrical, cable and telephone 
installations are permitted, but shall be installed in raceways and metallic outlet 
boxes. Electrical installation shall be installed in accordance with the adopted 
electrical code in Chapter 10 of the Bellevue City Code. Penetrations of electrical 
boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4.



Exception: A common 1-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in 
accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhouses equipped 
with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with NFPA 13, 
provided the common wall does not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, 
ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire 
exposure from both sides and shall extend to and be tight against exterior walls 
and underside of the roof sheathing. Electrical installations shall be installed in 
accordance with the adopted electrical code in Chapter 10 of the Bellevue City 
Code. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section 
R302.4. 

(5) Amend Section: R302.3 Two family dwellings. Delete exception #1 in its 
entirety.

(6) Amend Section R307.1 Space required, to provide as follows:

Fixtures shall be spaced as per Chapter 27 of the Bellevue Plumbing Code.

Delete Figure 307.1 Minimum fixture clearances, in its entirety.

(7) Delete R309.5 Fire sprinklers. Delete this section in its entirety. 

(8) Amend Section R310.1 Emergency escape and rescue opening required. 
Delete exception #2 in its entirety.

(9) Amend Section R310.6 Dwelling additions. Delete exception #3 in its entirety.

(10) Amend Section R310.7 Alterations or repairs of existing basements. to read 
as follows:

An emergency escape and rescue opening is required where existing basements 
undergo alterations or repairs.   

Exception: New sleeping rooms created in an existing basement shall be provided 
with emergency escape and rescue openings in accordance with Section R310.1 

(11) Amend Section R311.3.1 Floor elevations at the required front door, to read 
as follows:

The landing or floor on the exterior side shall be not more than 7-3/4” (196mm) 
below the top of the interior finished floor provided that the door does not swing 
over the landing or floor.

(12) Amend Section R311.3.2 Floor elevations at other exterior doors, to read as 
follows:

Doors other than the required egress door shall be provided with landings or floors 
not more than 7-3/4” (196mm) below the top of the finished floor.

Exception: A top landing is not required where a stairway of not more than three 
risers is located on the exterior side of the door, provided that the door does not 
swing over the stairway. 

(13) Amend Section R311.7.2 Headroom. Add the Following as a second 
paragraph:

The Building Official shall have the authority to waive the requirements of this 
section where pre-existing conditions will not allow the requirements to be met.

(14) Amend Section: R311.7.8.2 4Continuity. Add exception 3 to read as follows:

Exception 3. Handrails for stairways shall be permitted to have no more than a 4” 
break due to wall offsets and other ornamental features.

 (15)    Amend Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems, to read 



as follows:

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system is not required to be installed in 
townhouses.

 (16)     Amend Section R313.1.1 Design and installation, to read as follows:

Design and installation for non-required systems. When a non-required 
automatic residential fire sprinkler system is intended to be installed within a 
townhouse, the system shall be designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 
13 NFPA 13D or NFPA 13R.

 (17)    Amend Section R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems, 
to read as follows:

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system is not required to be installed in one- 
and two-family dwellings.

 (18)     Amend Section R313.2.1 Design and Installation, to read as follows:

Design and installation of non-required systems. When an automatic residential 
fire sprinkler system is intended to be installed, it shall be designed and installed 
in accordance with NFPA 13, NFPA 13D or NFPA 13R.

 (19)   Amend Section: R317.1 Location required. Change location #2 to read as 
follows:

All wood framing members, sills, or plates that rest on concrete or masonry walls.

(20) Delete Section R317.1.1 Field treatment. Delete this section in its entirety.

(21) Amend Section R318.1 Subterranean termite control methods., by deleting 
method #5 in its entirety and renumbering #6 to #5. 

(22) Delete Section R318.1.2 Field treatment. Delete this section in its entirety.

(23) Delete Section R318.3 Barriers. Delete this section in its entirety.

(24) Amend Section R326 Habitable attic, and subsections R326.1, R326.2 and 
R326.3 to read as follows:

A habitable attic shall not be considered a story where complying with all of the 
following requirements:

1. The occupiable floor area is not less than 70 square feet (6.5 m2), in 
accordance with Section R304.

2. The occupiable floor area has a ceiling height in accordance with 
Section R305. 

3. The occupiable space is enclosed by the roof assembly above, knee 
walls (if applicable) on the sides and the floor-ceiling assembly below.

4. The floor of the occupiable space shall not extend beyond the exterior 
walls of the floor below.

(25)     Amend Section R403.1.4.1 Frost protection, to read as follows:

Except where otherwise protected from frost, foundation walls, piers, and other 
permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be protected from frost by one 
or more of the following methods:

1. Extended below the frost line specified in Table R301.2 
2. Erected on solid rock.



Exceptions:

1. Protection of freestanding accessory structures with an 
area of 750 square feet or less, of light framed construction, with 
an eave height of ten feet or less shall not be required.

2. Protection of freestanding accessory structures with and 
area of 400 square feet or less, of other than light framed 
construction, with an eave height of ten feet or less shall not be 
required.

Footings shall not bear on frozen soil unless the frozen condition is 
permanent.

 
General note:

1.   Deck footings shall be twice the diameter of the
 supporting member.

(26) Delete Section R403.3 Frost protection shallow footings in its entirety.

(27) Delete Table R403.3 (1) in its entirety.

(28) Delete Figures R403.3 (1), R403.3 (3), R403.3 (4) and R403.4.(1) in their 
entirety.

(29) Delete Sections R403.3.1, R403.3.1.1, R403.3.1.2, R403.3.2, R403.3.3, 
R403.3.4 and R403.4.1 in their entirety.

(30) Delete Section R404.1.8 Rubble stone masonry in its entirety.

(31) Delete Section R404.2 Wood foundation walls, and subsections R404.2.1, 
R404.2.2, R404.2.3, R404.2.4, R404.2.5 and R404.2.6 in their entirety.

(32) Change Section R502.6.2 Joist Framing, to read as follows:

Joist framed into the side of a wood girder shall be supported by approved framing 
anchors.

(33) Amend Section 507.3 Footings. Delate all exceptions and amend to read as 
follows:

Decks shall be supported on concrete footings or other approved structural systems 
designed to accommodate all loads in accordance with Section R301.Deck footings 
shall extend below the frost line specified in Table R301.2 in accordance with 
Section R403.1.4.1 and sized to carry the imposed loads from the deck structure to 
the ground as shown in Table R507.3.1 

(34) Amend Section 507.3.1 Minimum size. Amend to read as follows:

The minimum size of concrete footings shall be in accordance with Table 
R507.3.1, and allowable soil-bearing pressure of 1,500a pounds per square foot.

a. Where the building official determines that in-place soils with and 
allowable bearing capacity of less than 1,500 psf are likely to be 
present at the site, the allowable bearing capacity shall be determined 
by a soil investigation.

(35) Delete Table R507.3.1 in its entirety and replace with new Table R507.3.1 
Minimum Footing Sizes for Decks.



       TABLE R507.3.1 MINIMUM FOOTING SIZES FOR DECKS

  Footing
   Depth

                                     Footing Diameter Allowed
                                (1,500 psf soil-bearing pressure)
8” diam 10” 

diam
12” diam 14” diam 16” diam 18” diam 20” diam

       42”  <941 lbs. < 1340 
lbs.

< 1805 lbs. <2334 lbs. <2930 lbs. <3591 lbs. <4316 lbs.

       48” <1481 lbs. <2071 lbs. <2747lbs <3509 lbs. <4360lbs <5298 lbs. <6323 lbs.

 Post diam 4x4 4x4 6x6 6x6 Engineered Engineered Engineered

(36) Amend Section R507.4 Deck posts. To read as follows:

For single-level decks, wood post size shall be in accordance with Table R507.3.1 
and post height in accordance with Table R507.4

(37) Delete Table R507.4 and replace with new Table R507.4

                     TABLE R507.4 DECK POST HEIGHT                          

            DECK POST SIZE             MAXIMUM HEIGHT
                             (FEET-INCHES)

                         4X4                                 6
                         4X6                                 8
                         6X6                                 14
                         8X8                                 14

 
(38)     Amend Section R903.4 Roof drainage, add to existing paragraph as follows:

When roofs are sloped to drain over the edge, scuppers or gutters and down spouts, 
adequately sized, pitched and supported, shall be installed to conduct rain water to 
ground level. Rain water shall be discharged at least three (3) feet away from the 
building foundation in a direction parallel to the adjoining property line.

Exception: Structures with no sub-grade spaces.

(39) Delete Section R908.3.1 Roof recover in its entirety.

(40) Amend Section R908.3.1.1 Roof recover not allowed to read as follow:

A roof recover shall not be permitted.

(41)       Add new Section R908.7 Roof maintenance – repair, to read as follows:

No roofing permit is required for any maintenance or repairs that are an 
accumulative of one roofing square (100’sq) or less provided there is only one 
layer of existing roof covering. Any reroofing exceeding one roofing square 
(100’sq) requires a permit and the entire roof to be brought up to current code.

(42) Delete Chapter 11, Energy Efficiency. Delete this chapter in its entirety and 
change to read as follows:

One- and Two-Family Dwellings shall be designed and constructed in accordance 
with the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code as amended in chapter 8, 
section 8-18 (B) of the Bellevue City Code.

 (43)   Delete Chapter 25 through Chapter 32 in their entirety and substitute the same 
with the following:

a. The plumbing requirements shall conform to the provisions of 
Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code.

b. When installed; Fire sprinkler systems shall be installed in 
accordance with NFPA 13, NFPA 13D or NFPA 13R.

 



(44)    Delete Chapter 33 through Chapter 42 in their entirety and substitute the same 
with the following:

a. The storm drainage requirements shall conform to the provisions 
of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code.

b. The electrical requirements shall conform to the provisions of 
Chapter 10 of the Bellevue City Code.

Section 2. That Section 8-18.6 of Chapter 8 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore existing are 
hereby repealed.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be published in pamphlet form.

Section 4. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval and 
publication as provided by law.

Passed and approved this ____day of ________________, 2021.

                                                                                               ____________________________       
                                                                          Mayor
Attest:

__________________________
City Clerk

First Reading: April 6, 2021                                        APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Second Reading: April 20, 2021                                      __________________________________
                                                                                             City Attorney
Third reading: May 4, 2021





                                                                         ORDINANCE NO. 4034

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTIONS 27-196 THROUGH 27-196.1 OF CHAPTER 27 OF 
THE BELLEVUE CITY CODE BY ADOPTING THE  2021 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
MECHANICAL CODE; TO REPEAL SECTIONS 27-196 THROUGH 27-196.1 OF THE BELLEVUE 
CITY CODE AS HERETOFORE EXISTING; TO PROVIDE FOR THE PUBLICATION OF THIS 
ORDINANCE IN PAMPHLET FORM; AND TO PROVIDE FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS 
ORDINANCE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BELLEVUE, 
NEGRASKA:

Section 1. That section 27-196 of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows:

Sec. 27-196. Adopted.

The International Mechanical Code, 2021 Edition, published by the International Code 
Council, Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this division as though set 
out in full herein; provided that whenever any provisions of the International Mechanical 
Code conflict with the provisions of the City Code or any other City Ordinance, the 
provisions of the City Code or such City Ordinance shall govern. Three (3) copies of the 
International Mechanical Code, 2021 Edition, are on file in the office of the Permits and 
Inspections Department and shall there remain for public use and inspection.

Section 2. That Section 27-196.1 of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to 
read as follows:

Sec. 27-196.1. Amendments and changes to the International Mechanical Code, 2021 Edition.

 (A) The International Mechanical Code, 2021 Edition, is amended and changed in the 
following respects:

(1) Delete Chapter 1 Administration, in its entirety.

(2) Amend Section 401.2 Ventilation required. To read as follows:

Every occupied space shall be ventilated by natural means in accordance 
with Section 402 or If needed by mechanical means in accordance with 
Section 403.

(3) Amend Section 403.2.1 Recirculation of air. To read as follows:

The outdoor air provided by Section 403.3 shall not be recirculated. Air in 
excess of that provided by Section 403.3 shall not be prohibited from being 
recirculated as a component of supply air to building spaces, except that:

(1) Ventilation air shall not be recirculated from one dwelling to another 
or to dissimilar occupancies.

(2) Supply air to a swimming pool and associated deck areas shall not be 
recirculated unless such air is dehumidified to maintain the relative 
humidity of the area at 60 percent or less. Air from this area shall not 
be recirculated to other spaces where more than 10 percent of the 
resulting supply airstream consists of air recirculated from these 
spaces.

(3) Where mechanical exhaust is required by Note b in Table 403.3.1.1, 
recirculation of air from such spaces shall be prohibited. Recirculation 
of air that is contained completely within such spaces is prohibited, all 



air supplied to such spaces shall be exhausted, including any air in 
excess of that required by Table 403.3.1.1

(4) Where mechanical exhaust is required by note g in Table 403.3.1.1, 
mechanical exhaust is required and recirculation from such spaces is 
prohibited where more than 10 percent of the resulting supply 
airstream consists of air recirculated from these spaces. Recirculation 
of air that is contained completely within such spaces shall not be 
prohibited.

(4) Amend Section 403.3 Outdoor air and local exhaust airflow rates. To 
read as follows:

When group R-2, R-3 and R-4 occupancies three stories and less in height 
above grade plane are provided with outdoor air and local exhaust they 
shall be in accordance with Section 403.3.2 Other buildings intended to be 
occupied may be provided with outdoor air and local exhaust in 
accordance with Section 403.3.1.

(5) Section 508.1.1 Makeup air temperature.

Delete this section in its entirety.

(6) Section 1101.9 Locking access port caps.

Delete this section in its entirety. 

Section 3. That Sections 27-196 and 27-196.1 of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore 
existing are hereby repealed.

Section 4. This Ordinance shall be published in pamphlet form.

Section 5. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval and 
publication as provided by law.

Passed and approved this ____day of ________________, 2021.

                                                                                            

   ____________________________       
                                                                          Mayor

Attest:

__________________________
City Clerk

First Reading April 6, 2021                                            APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Second Reading April 20, 2021                                 __________________________________
                                                                                             City Attorney
Third reading May 4, 2021





                                                              ORDINANCE NO. 4035

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTIONS 27-85 THROUGH 27-87 OF CHAPTER 27 OF THE 
BELLEVUE CITY CODE BY ADOPTING THE 2021 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM PLUMBING 
CODE; TO AMEND SECTION 27-85.1 OF THE BELLEVUE CITY CODE BY ADOPTING THE  2021 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE; TO AMEND SECTION 27-86 OF THE 
BELLEVUE CITY CODE BY ADOPTING THE  2021 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM SWIMMING 
POOL, SPA AND HOT TUB CODE; TO AMEND SECTION 27-87 OF THE BELLEVUE CITY CODE 
PERTAINING TO THE AMENDMENTS AND CHANGES TO THE NEWLY ADOPTED CODES; TO 
REPEAL SECTIONS 27-85 THROUGH 27-87 OF THE BELLEVUE CITY CODE AS HERETOFORE 
EXISTING; TO PROVIDE FOR THE PUBLICATION OF THIS ORDINANCE IN PAMPHLET FORM; 
AND TO PROVIDE FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BELLEVUE, 
NEBRASKA:

Section 1. That Section 27-85 of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows:

Sec. 27-85. Adopted.

The Uniform Plumbing Code, 2021 Edition, published by the International Association of 
Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this 
division as though set out in full herein; provided that whenever provisions of the Uniform 
Plumbing Code shall conflict with the provisions of the City Code or any other City 
Ordinance, the provisions of the City Code or such City Ordinance shall govern. Three (3) 
copies of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2021 edition, are on file in the office of the Permits 
and Inspections Department and shall there remain for public use and inspection.

Section 2. That Section 27-85.1 of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows:

Sec. 27-85.1. International Fuel Gas Code adopted.

The International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 Edition, published by the International Code 
Council Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this division as though set 
out in full herein; provided that whenever provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code 
shall conflict with the provisions of the City Code or any other City Ordinance shall govern. 
Three (3) copies of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 Edition, are on file in the office 
of the Permits and Inspections Department and shall there remain for public use and 
inspection. 

Section 3. That Section 27-86 of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows:

Sec. 27-86. Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code adopted.

The Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, 2021 Edition, published by the 
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, is hereby adopted by reference and made 
a part of this division as though set out in full herein; provided that whenever provisions of the Uniform 
Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code shall conflict with the provisions of the city Code or any other city 
ordinance, the provision of the city Code or such city ordinance shall govern. Three (3) copies of the 
Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, 2021 Edition, are on file in the office of the Permits and 
Inspections Department and shall there remain for public use and inspection.

Section 4. That Section 27-87 of Chapter 27 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows:

Sec. 27-87. Amendments and changes to the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2012 Edition, 
International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 Edition, and Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, 
2012 Edition.



(A) The Uniform Plumbing Code, 2021 Edition, is amended and changed in the following 
respects:

(1) Delete Chapter 1, Administration, in its entirety.

(2) Amend Table 422.1 footnotes to read as follows:

PLUMBING FIXTURES AND FIXTURE FITTINGS

1. The figures shown are based upon one (1) fixture being the minimum 
required for the number of persons indicated or any fraction thereof.

2. A restaurant is defined as a business that sells food to be consumed on the 
premises.

(a) The number of occupants for a drive-in restaurant shall be 
considered as equal to the number of parking stalls.

(b) Hand-washing facilities shall be available in the kitchen for 
employees.

3. The total number of required water closets for females shall be not less 
than the total number or required water closets and urinals for males.

4. For each urinal added in excess of the minimum required, one water closet 
shall be permitted to be deducted. The number of water closets shall not be reduced 
to less than two-thirds of the minimum requirements.

5. Metering or self-closing faucets shall be installed on lavatories intended 
to serve the transient public.

6. Laundry trays. One (1) laundry tray or one (1) automatic washer standpipe 
for each dwelling unit or one (1) laundry tray or one (1) automatic washer 
standpipe, or combination thereof, for each twelve (12) apartments. Kitchen sinks; 
one (1) for each dwelling or apartment unit.

7. Twenty-four (24) lineal inches (610 mm) of wash sink or eighteen (18) 
inches (557 mm) of a circular basin, when provided with water outlets for such 
space, shall be considered equivalent to one (1) lavatory.

(3) Delete Sections 506.0 through 506.9 of Chapter 5, Combustion Air, in their 
entirety.

(4) Delete Chapter 12 in its entirety.

(5) Delete Appendix H in its entirety, and substitute the following:

Private Sewage Disposal Systems shall be: “Title 124 Rules and Regulations for 
the Design, Operation and Maintenance of on-site wastewater treatment system 
“(Nebraska Department of Environment and Energy).”

(B) The International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 Edition, is amended and changed in the following 
respects:

(1) Delete Chapter 1, Administration, in its entirety.

Section 5. That Sections 27-85 through 27-87 of the Bellevue City Code as heretofore existing are 
hereby repealed.

Section 6. This Ordinance shall be published in pamphlet form.

Section 7. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval and 
publication as provided by law.

Passed and approved this ____day of ________________, 2021.



                                                                                            ____________________________    
Attest:                                                                          Mayor 

__________________________
City Clerk

First Reading    April 6, 2021                                                                               APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Second Reading April 20, 2021
                                                                                                      __________________________________
Third reading May 4, 2021                                          City Attorney































ORDINANCE NO. _4036_

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE OFFICIAL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF BELLEVUE, 
NEBRASKA, AS PROVIDED FOR BY ARTICLE 3 OF ORDINANCE NO. 3619 BY CHANGING THE ZONE 
CLASSIFICATION OF LAND LOCATED AT OR ABOUT 9100 SOUTH 13TH STREET, MORE PARTICULARLY 
DESCRIBED IN SECTION 1 OF THE ORDINANCE AND TO PROVIDE AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, having received a recommendation from the city of Bellevue Planning Commission and proper 
notice having been given and public hearing held as provided by law:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BELLEVUE, NEBRASKA:

Section 1. That part of the official zoning map of the City of Bellevue, Nebraska, as provided in Article 3, of 
Ordinance No. 3619 is hereby amended to change the zone classification of the following described parcel of land:

Lot 1, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, being a replat of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, located 
in the Southeast ¼ of Section 22, T14N, R13E of the 6th P.M., Sarpy County, Nebraska. 

From RE (Residential Estates) to RE (Residential Estates);

AND 

Lots 2 and 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, being a replat of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, 
located in the Southeast ¼ of Section 22, T14N, R13E of the 6th P.M., Sarpy County, Nebraska.

From AG (Agricultural) to RG-50 (General Residential – 5,000 Square Foot Zone).

(DWS Land Surveying)

Section 2. This ordinance shall not take effect until such time as the final plat of Old Orchard Place Replat 2, is 
filed with the Sarpy County Register of Deeds in accordance with Section 5-10 of the City of Bellevue Subdivision 
Regulations.

Section 3. Except as amended herein, the official zoning map and the classification shown therein shall remain as 
heretofore existing.

Section 4. This ordinance shall take affect and be in force from and after its adoption and publication according 
to law.

 

ADOPTED by the Mayor and City Council this ______ day of ____________________, 2021.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

_____________________________
City Attorney

ATTEST

____________________________ ________________________________
City Clerk Mayor

First Reading: 04/06/20201
Second Reading: 04/20/2021
Third Reading: 05/04/2021












































































































	Agenda
	1. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
	2. INVOCATION - Father Tom Jones, Church of the Holy Spirit (Episcopal), 1305 Thomas Drive.
	3. CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL
	4. OPEN MEETINGS ACT - Posted in the Entry to the Council Chambers
	5. APPROVAL OF AGENDA, CONSENT AGENDA, CLAIMS, AND ADVISORY COMMITTEE REPORTS:
	a. Approval of the Agenda
	b. Approval of the Consent Agenda (Items marked with an (*) are approved where this item is, unless otherwise removed)
	1. * Acknowledge Receipt of the April 16, 2021 Board of Health Meeting Minutes.
	5b1. April 16, 2021 BOH Minutes

	2. * Approval of the April 20, 2021 Board of Equalization  Meeting Minutes.
	5b2. April 20, 2021 BOE Minutes

	3. * Approval of the April 20, 2021 City Council Minutes.
	5b3. April 20, 2021 City Council Minutes

	4. *  Acknowledge Receipt of the April 22, 2021 Planning Commission Minutes.
	5b4. April 22, 2021 Planning Commission Minutes



	6. * APPROVAL OF CLAIMS
	6. Claims for May 4, 2021

	7. SPECIAL PRESENTATIONS:  None
	8. ORGANIZATIONAL MATTERS:  None
	9. APPROVED CITIZEN COMMUNICATION:  None Received
	10. LIQUOR LICENSES:
	a. Recommend approval of a Special Designated Liquor License for Paul R. Klabunde dba "Century Lounge to sell beer, wine, and distilled spirits at a BBQ Kickoff, to be held at 2109 Franklin Street, Bellevue, on June 6, 2021 from 8:00 a.m. to 12:00 a.m.  (City Clerk)
	10a. Cover Sheet for SLD for Century Bar
	10a. Staff Report SDL for Century Lounge for BBQ Kickoff

	b. Recommend approval of application for Sarah Norman Rowe as the new Manager for Midwest Catering and Events, LLC dba "Patricia's Catering" at 439 Galvin Road N., Bellevue.  (City Clerk)
	10b. Cover Sheet for Manager Application Patricia's Catering
	10b. Staff Report Manager Application for Patricias Catering


	11. ORDINANCES FOR ADOPTION (3rd reading):
	a. Ordinance No. 4030:  Amending Section 12-57 through 12-85, of the Municipal Code pertaining to Fireworks.  (City Clerk)
	11a. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4030
	11a. Ord. No. 4030 Fireworks - Clean Copy
	11a. Ord. No. 4030 Fireworks - Clean Copy.docx

	b. Ordinance No. 4031: Ordinance pertaining to Adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	11b. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4031
	11b. Ord. No. 4031 Amendments to 2021 Fire (002)

	c. Ordinance No. 4032: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International Building Code, International Residential Code and the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	11c. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4032
	11c. Ord. No. 4032 Amendments to 2021 IBC

	d. Ordinance No. 4033: Ordinance pertaining to amendments of the 2021 International Residential Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	11d. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4033
	11d. Ord. No. 4033 Amendments to 2021 IRC

	e. Ordinance No. 4034: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International Mechanical Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	11e. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4034
	11e. Ord. No. 4034 Amendments to 2021 Mechanical Code

	f. Ordinance No. 4035: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 Uniform Plumbing Code; Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code and the 2021 International Fuel Gas Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	11f. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4035
	11f. Ord. No. 4035 amendments to 2021 Plumbing-fuel-gas-pool

	g. Ordinance No. 4036:  Request to rezone Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, being a replat of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, from AG and RE to RE and RG-50, for the purpose of existing residential development.  Applicant:  DWS Land Surveying.  General location:  9100 S 13th Street.  (Planning Manager)
	1. Approval of small subdivision plat Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2.
	12a1. Small Subdivision Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2
	11g1. Small Subdivision Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2

	2. Approval of waiver of Section 6-7 (8) of the Subdivision Regulations for flag lots.
	11g. 11g1. and 11g2. Cover Sheet
	11g. 11g1. and 11g2. Staff Report Ord. No. 4036
	11g. As Built
	11g. GIS Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2
	11g. Ord. No. 4036 Rezone Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2
	11g. Small Subdivision Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2
	11g. Zoning Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2
	11g1. Small Subdivision Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2


	12. ORDINANCES FOR PUBLIC HEARING (2nd reading):
	13. ORDINANCES FOR INTRODUCTION (1st reading):
	a. Ordinance No. 4037:  An Ordinance to add new sections to Chapter 6 regarding leash and muzzle requirements for pit bull breeds, breed ambassadors, insurance, and the NHS annual reporting procedures.  (Councilman Burns)
	13a. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4037
	13a. Ord. No. 4037 Leash and Muzzle Requirements

	b. +++  Item removed

	14. PUBLIC HEARING ON MATTERS OTHER THAN ORDINANCES:
	a. Request to final plat Lots 1 through 263 and Outlots A and D, Alta Collina, being a platting of the South 1/2 of the Northeast 1/4 of Section 7, T13, R13E of the 6th P.M., Sarpy County, Nebraska.  Applicant: Orchard Valley, LLC  General Location: 48th Street and Lookingglass Drive.  (Planning Manager)
	1. Approval of the Alta Collina Subdivision Agreement
	14a1.  Alta Collina Subdivision Agreement

	14a. and 14a1. Cover Sheet Final Plat Alta Collina
	14a. Staff Report final plat Alta Collina


	15. RESOLUTIONS:  None
	16. CURRENT BUSINESS:  None
	17. ADMINISTRATION REPORTS: Comments must be limited to items on the current Reports (Monthly reports are given at the first Council Meeting of every month - April report is attached.)
	17a. Admin Report

	18. CLOSED SESSION:
	19. ADJOURNMENT

