
Bellevue City Council Meeting   +++Amended Agenda+++
Tuesday, April 20, 2021 6:00 PM
Bellevue City Hall
1500 Wall Street
Bellevue, NE 68005

1. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
2. INVOCATION - Pastor Joseph Gastineau, Revival Tabernacle Church, 2226 Jefferson Street.
3. CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL
4. OPEN MEETINGS ACT - Posted in the Entry to the Council Chambers
5. APPROVAL OF AGENDA, CONSENT AGENDA, CLAIMS, AND ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
REPORTS: 

a. Approval of the Agenda
b. Approval of the Consent Agenda (Items marked with an (*) are approved where this 
item is, unless otherwise removed)

1. * Acknowledge Receipt of March 25, 2021 Planning Commission Minutes. 
2. * Acknowledge Receipt of March 31, 2021 Board of Health Minutes. 
3. * Approval of April 6, 2021 City Council Minutes.
4. *  Acknowledge Receipt of March 3, 2021 Sidewalk Task Force Minutes.
5. *  Acknowledge Receipt of March 9, 2021 Tree Board Meeting Minutes.

6. * APPROVAL OF CLAIMS.
7. SPECIAL PRESENTATIONS:

a. Proclamation declaring April 20, 2021 as "Arbor Day" in the City of Bellevue. (Councilman 
Preister)

8. ORGANIZATIONAL MATTERS:
a. *  Recommend reappointment of John Perrin and Leland Jacobson to the Citizens 
Complete Street Advisory Panel, for a four-year term ending April 2025 (Mayor)

9. APPROVED CITIZEN COMMUNICATION:  None Received
10. LIQUOR LICENSES: None
11. ORDINANCES FOR ADOPTION (3rd reading):

a. Approve Ordinance No. 4029 to amend Article VI, Chapter 19 of the Bellevue Municipal 
Code by adding a new Section 19-83 regarding prohibition of engine braking.  (Public Works 
Director)

12. ORDINANCES FOR PUBLIC HEARING (2nd reading):
a. Ordinance No. 4036:  Request to rezone Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, 
being a replat of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, from AG and RE to RE and RG-
50, for the purpose of existing residential development.  Applicant:  DWS Land Surveying.  
General location:  9100 S 13th Street.  (Planning Manager) 

1. Approval of small subdivision plat Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2.  (No 
action taken at this meeting.)
2. Approval of waiver of Section 6-7 (8) of the Subdivision Regulations for flag lots. (No 
action taken at this meeting.)

b. Ordinance No. 4030:  Amending Section 12-57 through 12-85, of the Municipal Code 
pertaining to Fireworks.  (City Clerk)
c. Ordinance No. 4031: Ordinance pertaining to Adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code.  
(Chief Building Inspector)
d. Ordinance No. 4032: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International Building 
Code, International Residential Code and the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code.  
(Chief Building Inspector)
e. Ordinance No. 4033: Ordinance pertaining to amendments of the 2021 International 



Residential Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
f. Ordinance No. 4034: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International 
Mechanical Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
g. Ordinance No. 4035: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 Uniform Plumbing 
Code; Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code and the 2021 International Fuel Gas 
Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)

13. ORDINANCES FOR INTRODUCTION (1st reading):  None
14. PUBLIC HEARING ON MATTERS OTHER THAN ORDINANCES:  None
15. RESOLUTIONS:

a. Resolution No. 2021-11:  A resolution ratifying all actions taken by the City Council during 
virtual meetings.  (Legal)

16. CURRENT BUSINESS:
a. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the CDBG-CV Round 3 Subrecipient Agreement 
with the Bellevue Public School Foundation for the COVID-19 PPE Emergency Assistance, in 
an amount not to exceed $8,904.00. (CDBG Program Specialist / Finance Director)
b. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the CDBG-CV Round 3 Subrecipient Agreement 
with All Communities Outreach Services for the COVID-19 Companionship and Outreach 
Assistance, in an amount not to exceed $29,907.00. (CDBG Program Specialist / Finance 
Director)
c. Approve & authorize the Mayor to sign the agreement with DIY Holding Company, LLC for 
the 2021 Concrete Pavement Rehab Project, in an amount not to exceed $396,818.00, plus a 
10% contingency of $39,681.80, for a total project cost of $436,499.80.  (Public Works 
Director)
d. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Professional Engineering Services Agreement 
with Jacobs Engineering Group Inc. for the seven sites in the Storm Drainage Improvement 
Project, in an amount not to exceed $241,757.00. (Public Works Director) 
e. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Professional Services Agreement with Alfred 
Benesch & Company for the Municipal Separate Storm Sewer System (MS4) Annual 
Reporting, in an amount not to exceed $17,880.00. (Public Works Director)
f. +++ Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Lease Agreement Addendum with the 
DMV located at 14402 Harlan Lewis Road, extending the terms for one year with an expiration 
date of April 30, 2022.  (City Administrator)
g. Recommendation to approve a Special Fireworks Application for Twisted Thunder 
Fireworks to provide a Special Fireworks Display for the Schankenberg wedding, at the View, 
1102 Country Club Ct., on 05/21/21 at dusk for approximately 5 minutes.  (City Clerk)
h. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Purchase and Sale Agreement conveying 
13407 Spencer Circle, which city acquired upon annexation, to Aimee and Brant Hill, in the 
amount of $32,000.00.  (Administration)

17. ADMINISTRATION REPORTS: Comments must be limited to items on the current 
Reports (Monthly reports are given at the first Council Meeting of every month - April report 
will be attached to May 4th Council packet).
18. CLOSED SESSION:
19. ADJOURNMENT



    *5b1
4/20/2021









4/20/2021
   5b2.



























































































ORDINANCE NO. _4036_

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE OFFICIAL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF BELLEVUE, 
NEBRASKA, AS PROVIDED FOR BY ARTICLE 3 OF ORDINANCE NO. 3619 BY CHANGING THE ZONE 
CLASSIFICATION OF LAND LOCATED AT OR ABOUT 9100 SOUTH 13TH STREET, MORE PARTICULARLY 
DESCRIBED IN SECTION 1 OF THE ORDINANCE AND TO PROVIDE AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, having received a recommendation from the city of Bellevue Planning Commission and proper 
notice having been given and public hearing held as provided by law:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BELLEVUE, NEBRASKA:

Section 1. That part of the official zoning map of the City of Bellevue, Nebraska, as provided in Article 3, of 
Ordinance No. 3619 is hereby amended to change the zone classification of the following described parcel of land:

Lot 1, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, being a replat of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, located 
in the Southeast ¼ of Section 22, T14N, R13E of the 6th P.M., Sarpy County, Nebraska. 

From RE (Residential Estates) to RE (Residential Estates);

AND 

Lots 2 and 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, being a replat of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, 
located in the Southeast ¼ of Section 22, T14N, R13E of the 6th P.M., Sarpy County, Nebraska.

From AG (Agricultural) to RG-50 (General Residential – 5,000 Square Foot Zone).

(DWS Land Surveying)

Section 2. This ordinance shall not take effect until such time as the final plat of Old Orchard Place Replat 2, is 
filed with the Sarpy County Register of Deeds in accordance with Section 5-10 of the City of Bellevue Subdivision 
Regulations.

Section 3. Except as amended herein, the official zoning map and the classification shown therein shall remain as 
heretofore existing.

Section 4. This ordinance shall take affect and be in force from and after its adoption and publication according 
to law.

 

ADOPTED by the Mayor and City Council this ______ day of ____________________, 2021.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

_____________________________
City Attorney

ATTEST

____________________________ ________________________________
City Clerk Mayor

First Reading: 04/06/20201
Second Reading: ________________
Third Reading: _________________















































 ORDINANCE NO. 4031 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTIONS 12-2, 12-36 THROUGH 12-36.1 AND 12-170 OF 

THE BELLEVUE MUNICIPAL CODE PERTAINING TO THE BELLEVUE FIRE PREVENTION 

CODE; TO REPEAL SECTIONS 12-2, 12-36 THROUGH 12-36.1 AND 12-170 OF THE BELLEVUE 

CITY CODE AS HERETOFORE EXISTING; TO PROVIDE FOR THE PUBLICATION OF THIS 

ORDINANCE IN PAMPHLET FORM; AND TO PROVIDE FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS 

ORDINANCE. 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

BELLEVUE, NEBRASKA. 

Section 1. That Section 12-2 of the Bellevue Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

Sec. 12-2. Fire Hydrants generally 

(a) No building shall be erected within the city limits and within the extra-territorial zoning 

jurisdiction of the city, unless it shall be protected by sufficient approved type fire hydrants in 

accordance with Section 506 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies and Appendix B Fire Flow 

Required for Buildings of the 2012 2021 International Fire Code. 

(b)  Where compliance with this section requires the installation of private hydrants, such 

hydrants will be installed at the expense of the property owner requiring such hydrants. These 

hydrants shall be served by a minimum of a 6-inch main and shall be certified, inspected, flow 

tested, and maintained by the Metropolitan Utilities District. 

(c) All fire hydrant systems shall meet the approval of the fire department as to installation 

and location. Plans and specifications shall be submitted to the fire department for review and 

approval prior to construction. 

(d) Building construction or storage areas shall not be started prior to the hydrant system 

being placed in service. 

Section 2. That Section 12-36 of the Bellevue Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

Sec. 12-36. Adoption of International Fire Code 

There is hereby adopted by the city of Bellevue, Nebraska, for the purpose of prescribing 

regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or explosion, that 

certain code known as the 2012 2021 International Fire Code, being particular the edition in use 

the year of which shall correspond with the same year of the building code being currently used 

by the City of Bellevue, including appendices, of which code not less than three (3) copies have 

been and are now filed in the office of the Fire Marshal, and the same is hereby adopted and 

incorporated as fully set out at length herein; provided that whenever any provision shall conflict 

with the provisions of the City Code, or any other City ordinance, the provision of the City Code 

or other such ordinance shall govern. 

Section 3. That Section 12-36.1 of the Bellevue Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

Sec. 12-36.1 Amendments and changes to code adopted in Sec 12-36 adoption of International 

Fire Code. 

(A) The International Fire Code, 2012 2021 Edition, is amended and changed in the 

following respects: 

(1) Amend Section 308.1.4 Open flame cooking devices. By deleting exception 2 

and by changing exception 3 to read as follows: 

Exceptions: 



2. LP-gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not 

greater than 20 pounds. 

 (2) Amend Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Change “20 feet” to “24 feet”. 

 (3) Delete Section 503.2.7 Grade, and substitute the following language: 

  “The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be a maximum of 10%” 

 (4) Delete Section 507.5.3 (1) and substitute the following language: 

Private fire hydrants (all types) shall be certified, inspected, flow tested, and 

maintained by the Metropolitan Utilities District. 

 (5) Section 609.1 General. Insert “and NFPA 96” 

 (6) Section 903.2.8 Group R. Add Exception to read as follows. 

  Exception: Sprinkler systems are not required in R-3 One- and two-family 

dwellings, or Townhouses that are separated into separate buildings by a 

common two (2) hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance 

with ASTM E 119 or UL 263. Such walls shall not contain plumbing or 

mechanical equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall 

shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides and shall extend to and be tight 

against exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. Electrical, cable 

and telephone installations are permitted, but shall be installed in accordance 

with the adopted electrical code in Chapter 10 of the Bellevue City Code. 

Penetrations of electrical boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4 2012 

IRC.    

 (7) Section 903.2.12 During Construction. Change “Section 3313” to “Section 

3314” 

 (8)(7) Amend Section 3405.1 Individual piles. Add new first sentence, “These 

regulations shall apply to outdoor storage of tires where fifty (50) or more tires 

are stored”. Change “5,000 square feet (464.5 M2)” to “2,500 square feet (232.3 

M2)” and change “50,000 cubic feet (1416 M3)” to “25,000 cubic feet (707.92 

M3)”. Add, “A maximum of two tire piles may be established on a single site”. 

 (9)(8) Delete Section 3405.6 

 (10)(9) Add Section 3405.8 Bond. Add as a new Section to read as follows: 

  Bond. As a condition of the issuance or continuation of any permit authorizing 

the outdoor storage of tires, the applicant or permittee shall file with the city 

clerk a bond in favor of the City, with good and sufficient surety, in the amount 

of $20,000. This bond shall be conditioned that the applicant or permittee, as 

principal, shall faithfully perform all of the requirements imposed upon the 

outdoor tire storage operation by federal, state, and local law; and shall perform 

such cleanup, moving or removal of tires as is required by federal, state or local 

law. This section shall apply immediately to all applications or renewal requests 

submitted after the effective date of this Section. 

  Holders of permits as of the effective date of this Section shall file the required 

bond within 90 days of the effective date of this Section. 

  Once every two (2) years after the effective date of this Section, the City shall 

inspect all sites licensed under this Section. If such an inspection finds that the 

fair and reasonable cost to lawfully remove and dispose of all tires stored on the 

site exceeds $20,000, then the amount of the required bond for that site shall be 

immediately increased to equal that cost. In such case, the license holder shall be 

so notified, and shall provide the required bond within thirty (30) days. Nothing 

in this Section shall be construed to permit the storage of a volume of tires in 

excess of that which is otherwise allowed by law. 



 (11)(10) Amend Section 3407.1 Where required.  To read as follows: 

  Where required.  A firmly anchored fence or other approved method of security 

that controls unauthorized access to the storage yard shall surround the storage 

yard. 

 (12)(11) Amend Section 3407.2 Construction. Change “6 feet (1829mm) high” to “10 

feet (2048mm high)”. 

 (13)(12) Amend Section 3504.2.1 When required. Change “30 minutes” to “2 hours” 

and change “extend” to “modify” 

 (14)(13) Amend Section 5601.1.3 Fireworks. 

  Delete Exceptions 1 and 2 and renumber 3 and 4. 

 (15)(14) Amend Appendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads: Change all 20 feet widths 

to 24 feet widths. 

 (B) Chapter 80 The following Reference Standards for this Fire Code are amended as 

follows:  

   (1)  Change “ICCEC-12 21 ICC Electrical Code” to “Electrical Code: The 

electrical code for this jurisdiction shall be as adopted by Chapter 10 of the 

Bellevue Municipal Code and all codes adopted therein” 

  (2) Change “IBC-12 21 International Building Code” to Building Code: The 

building code for the jurisdiction shall be as adopted by Chapter 8 of the 

Bellevue Municipal Code and all codes adopted therein”. 

  (3) Delete “IEBC-12 21 International Existing Building Code”. 

  (4) Change “IFGC-12 21 International Fuel Gas Code” to “Fuel Gas Code: 

The fuel gas code for this jurisdiction shall be as adopted in Chapter 27 to the 

Bellevue Municipal Code”. 

  (5) Change “IMC-12 21 International Mechanical Code” to “Mechanical 

Code: The mechanical code for this jurisdiction shall be as adopted by Chapter 

27 of the Bellevue Municipal Code”. 

  (6)  Change “IPC-12 21 International Plumbing Code” to “Plumbing Code: 

The plumbing code for this jurisdiction shall be as adopted by Chapter 27 of the 

Bellevue Municipal Code”. 

  (7) Change “IRC-12 21 International Residential Code” to “International 

Residential Code: The International Residential Code shall be as adopted by 

Chapter 8 of the Bellevue Municipal Code”. 

  (8) Delete. “IUWIC-12 21 International Urban-Wildlife Interface Code”. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

Section 4. That Sections 12-170 of the Bellevue Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

Sec.12-170. Signs 

 

 All signs shall meet the requirements of the 2012 2021 International Fire Code, Appendix D. If 

there is a curb along the fire lane, the curb shall be painted red. 



Section 5. That Sections 12-2, 12-36 through 12-36.1 and 12-170 of Chapter1 of the Bellevue 

City Code as heretofore existing are hereby repealed. 

Section 6. This Ordinance shall be published in pamphlet form. 

Section 7. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval and 

publication as provided by law. 

Passed and approved this ____day of ________________, 2021. 

       ____________________________       

     Mayor 

Attest: 

__________________________ 

City Clerk 

First Reading 04/06/2021       APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

Second Reading______________        __________________________________ 

     City Attorney 

Third reading________________ 













1 

 

   
5712 Rees Street, Omaha, NE 68106-1254 

phone:  (402) 651-3278 

email:  leon.lifetime@cox.net 

 

April 19, 2021 

To Mayor Hike & City Council Members 

Concerns for Energy Code modifications stated in Ord. 4032 

This letter is written out of a concern that certain changes or modification to the 2018 IECC energy code 
will impact the health, safety and energy costs for new homeowners and occupants in the Bellevue area.  
The following notes recommend sections such as Air Leakage (Blower Door) Tests, Mechanical 
Ventilation & Building Cavities used as Ducts revert to the original codes and that others are modified. 

First, I want to acknowledge that I write as a RESNET certified HERS Energy Rater who has done 
energy efficiency analysis and related code compliance tests in Eastern Nebraska and Western Iowa for 
the past 14 years. My HERS Rater’s training includes Building Science (how buildings work & fail), 
Best Building Practices as well as Blower Door and other test equipment usage. 

Prior to this, I worked for over 25 years as a Housing Rehab Inspector managing the City of Omaha's 
Emergency Repair program.  During that time, I saw numerous structural and mechanical problems 
which could have been prevented if built to modern standards. Consequently, I have a deep respect for 
all Building and related codes as well as uniform and unbiased inspections or testing procedures. 

Current & Proposed Codes 

• Bellevue currently enforces the 2009 IECC energy code mandated by the State of Nebraska 

• Every 3 years, the International Code Council gives extensive reviews to numerous building codes 
with updated editions issued in 2012, 2015, 2018 and now 2021 

• The State of Nebraska has mandated changing to the 2018 IECC with this quote from LB405: 

 The Legislature finds that consumers have an expectation that newly built houses or buildings 

they buy meet uniform energy efficiency standards. Therefore, the Legislature finds that there is a 

need to adopt the 2018 International Energy Code, in order… to ensure that a minimum energy 

standard is maintain throughout the state (and) to increase energy savings for all Nebraska 

consumers, especially low-income Nebraskans… 

• During the past year, I called Mike Christensen a few times to see how or when Bellevue would 
adopt the 2018 code. Although we had no formal meetings, he indicated that they might include 
certain modifications made by the City of Omaha for consistency within the Metro Building area. 

Ordinance #4032  / 2018 IECC Codes: 

Item B 3:  Section R402.1 Changing Basement Wall Insulation Values 

 This item reads simply to change the “Basement Wall R-value to…13” 
 This is a bit confusing since the 2009 IECC values = 10/13 . . . and the 2018 IECC values = 15/19 

• Footnotes explain the 1st number is the R-value for continuous wall insulation; the 2nd is 
for frame wall cavity insulation. 

 It’s unclear if the single R-13 is meant to refer to one or both conditions. Either way, it’s below the 
2018 values and needs further clarification. 

 



2 

 

Item B 3:  Section R402.1.2 Testing 

 This brief, one line comment completely deletes a Mandatory requirement for Building Air Leakage 
or Blower Door testing (see Note #1 for original text on pg. 4) 

 Air Sealing practices are outlined in the code which requires a visual inspection – but air is invisible 
and sealing practices cannot be fully evaluated without testing the building’s air leakage rate 

 Building air leakage is tested with a Blower Door (photo pg. 4) and measured in units of Air 
Changes per Hour (ACH)).  The 2012 IECC & subsequent editions give a reasonable 3.0 ACH limit. 

 Many local Builders regularly test between 2.0 to 2.5 ACH.  Those who slightly exceed the limit can 
follow advice of an experienced HERS Rater or tester to quickly locate & seal typical leakage areas. 

 Only the most severe air leakages require additional investigation including Thermal Imaging or IR 
scans to locate and correct problem areas…and a Code Compliance retest. 

 The preceding tests are also used to investigate consumer complaints of drafty rooms or moisture 

problems…sometimes initiated by a conscientious Builder to correct…other times, these tests are 
accompanied by an angry Homeowner with his/her attorney in tow. 

 The State of Iowa currently enforces a Modified 2012 IECC with an “introductory” 4.0 ACH limit. 
Sadly, a few local Builders miss this mark but usually pass after sealing notable leaks during the test. 

 It’s been almost a decade since the 2012 IECC Air Leakage Test Mandate was written and it’s 
unknown when a similar Nebraska code will resurface.  Bellevue should consider adopting this Test 

requirement in its original form to protect its citizens as stated in LB405…or consider Iowa’s 
modified 4.0 ACH limit to help local Builders either prove or improve their building practices. 

Item B 7:  Section R403.6 Mechanical Ventilation (Mandatory) 

 The disagreement here is that the proposed modification states “When buildings…are provided with 
Mechanical Ventilation…” opposed the original code’s “The building shall be provided with 
ventilation…” The difference is the proposal is a “when or IF” statement opposed to a definite 
Mandate. (see Note #2 for original text on pg. 4) 

 There’s a moto in the Building Science community to: “Build it tight and ventilate right.”  This 
acknowledges the importance to “build tight” for energy efficiency but to also provide Indoor Air 
Quality and some moisture control for building’s occupants. 

 Most experts recommend ventilation in homes below 3.0 ACH and definitely below 2.0 ACH. 
 Prospective Homeowners can’t evaluate these items without a Blower Door test report.  However, 

it’d be best to install a Ventilation system and provide homeowners information how it’s used. 
 Builders often complain Ventilation systems are cost prohibitive -- but 3 methods are approved: 

• An Exhaust-Only method – usually a high-tech Bath fan replacing a “standard“ Bath fan. 

• An Air Cycler system – a mid-priced system providing outdoor air into the HVAC ductwork. 

• A Balanced system (usually an Energy Recovery Ventilator or ERV) – this is the preferred 
method but comes with a $2,000+ cost. 

 A case in point:  I recently talked to a former Iowa customer whose house tested at 1.4 ACH. An 
ERV was planned but not installed.  Recently he discovered moldy Basement wall insulation and 
needs to make repairs, dehumidify. . . and finally install an ERV 

Item B 4:  Section R403.3.3 Duct Testing – an amendment for an Exception 

 This item is actually a subsection of the larger Section R403 Ducts which states numerous ductwork 
requirements. One intent of these codes is to assure ducts are properly sealed, insulated and tested to 
assure minimal cross-contaminations of air leaks in unconditioned spaces such as Attics. 

 This item states: ”A duct air leakage test shall not be required for ducts that are spray foamed with 
closed cell foam” but lacks a clear definition of acceptable ductwork or other code requirements. 

 A continuous 1.5 inch coating of closed cell foam should provide good duct sealing and insulation 
value on sheet metal ducts – but it should not be used on flex vinyl ducts due to the product’s high 
temperature application. 

 Many duct systems are a” hybrid” using both metal and flex duct…the flex portion would be 
questionable thus requiring duct testing. (see photos page 4) 

 This item needs further clarification. 



3 

 

 

Item B 4:  Section R403.3.5 Building Cavities allowed as Return ductwork 

 The original 2018 code reads: “R403.3.5 Building Cavities (Mandatory) Building framing cavities 

shall not be used as ducts or plenums.” 

 The practice of using wooden building cavities such as floor joists and stud walls for Return ducts 
goes back to the early 1900's. No doubt, this is a familiar and convenient construction method. 

 This practice was prohibited under the 2012 & subsequent codes partially since it allows 
building dust & contaminants into the HVAC system and is difficult to seal for code compliance  

 Although these Return Air (RA) systems do not require duct tests by themselves, I have tested 
countless of these systems while testing 2 story homes with Attic ducts. Here’s my observations: 

• Sometimes Duct Tests are done after a Mechanical Inspector’s tentative approval of a visual 
Rough-In inspection. Some of the following were found afterwards during a failed test. 

• Some slight overages are at unsealed metal duct to wood framing joints above RA trunklines at 
other beyond-line-of-site areas. These are quickly Mastic-sealed on-site for a passing score. 

• Missing joist-space RA headers are also overlooked and can prohibit a duct pressurization test. 

• Other severe HVAC technician oversights and multiple minor leaks require hours of additional 
investigate and sealing work – sometimes including a fogger or “smoke” test to detect leaks. 

• See related photos on page 5. 
 Most HVAC contractors do good duct sealing work, the above documents their occasional misses or 

the additional attention needed to “squeak-by”and pass the 2009 leakage rates. 
 Sometimes contractors fail a Rough-In test and will retest at the more generous Final leakage rate. 

The following chart shows this may no longer be an option: 

      * HVAC Duct Leakage Rates:         
            Rough-In      Final      Outside Leaks     Bldg. Cavities Used for Returns 
Current 2009 IECC                  6 cfm       12 cfm         8 cfm        allowed by the2009 code 

Iowa modified 2012 IECC  6 cfm        6 cfm         4 cfm               IA mod allows but requires testing 

2018 IECC    4 cfm        4 cfm        1.5 cfm          IECC prohibits / allowed per proposal 

*   Duct Leakage limits are calculated at the stated cfm per 100 sq ft of conditioned floor space. 
 

 One way to assure successful duct leakage rates may be to revert to the original 2018 IECC code 
prohibition…or encourage local HVAC contractors to “up their game” and buy a large supply of 
Mastic Sealant. 

 
Feel free to contact me if you have any questions or wish to discuss the letter further 
 
 

Respectfully yours, 

 
 
Copy: Mike Christensen 



4 

 

 

Supplemental Notes & Photos 

#1  2018 IRC & IECC Air Leakage / Blower Door Test  

        
 

#2  2018 IECC Mandatory Mechanical Ventilation 

 
 

  
A “hybrid” spray-foamed metal & flex duct system . . . & register end of the flex. 

 

 

Wintertime snow 

melt directly above 

the insufficiently 

sealed or insulated 

flex duct connection 

shown in the above 

right photo  



5 

 

   
Leakage areas on sheet metal ducts are usually quite visiable & easy to seal 

  

Unsealed metal RA Trunk to Joist connections are often unnoticed but add to leakage 

   

    Wood is an imperfect material:  a full-length             This 2-inch overcut was not visible from 

check in this framing material leaked & was sealed        below & was difficult to seal 

  
Missing RA Headers are often not noticed – but can create negative 

pressure zones that backdraft gas-fired Water Heater flues 



 
6323 N. 115th Circle 
Omaha, NE 68164 
www.o-heat.com 
mark@o-heat.com   
402.250.2791 

 
April 19, 2021 
 
Bellevue Mayor Rusty Hike, Chief Inspector Mike Christensen and City Council, 
 
I have been doing blower-door tests and duct leakage tests for code compliance in Eastern Nebraska 
and Western Iowa for the past 12 years. For the past 3 ½ years, that has included blower-door testing to 
indicate whether newly-built houses in Iowa comply with the 2012 International Energy Efficiency 
Code (2012 IECC), as required by Iowa building code. Iowa amended the 2012 IECC, relaxing the 
allowed leakage limit from 3 air changes per hour (ACH) at the test pressurization of -50 Pascals to 4 
ACH.  
 
The Iowa code requires whole-house mechanical ventilation on all new houses which are tight enough 
to pass the tightness requirement, but the ventilation requirement is not being enforced. Ventilation is 
functionally optional. 
 
Over the past 12 months, I did blower-door tests on 46 new houses. Of those, the median air tightness 
measurement was 1.92 ACH. Note that this is more than twice as tight as the code requires, and is well 
within the range where mechanical ventilation is officially required. The blower-door test report 
includes a recommended rate of whole-house ventilation. The test usually costs the builder less than 
$200. 
 
Houses today are being built much more air-tight than the homes most of us live in. This is good for 
saving energy, but not for the health of the families living in the newer houses. Indoor air pollutants 
from occupant activities and from outgassing building materials can accumulate in unventilated houses. 
For the health of occupants, ventilation is required. And to know the right amount of ventilation, the 
air-tightness of the house must be measured with a blower-door test. 
 
Sincerely,  
 

 
 
Mark Loscutoff 





City of Bellevue 
Michael Christensen 
1510 Wall St 
Bellevue, NE 68005 

April 9, 2021 

Dear Michael, 

On behalf of the Metro Omaha Builders Association (MOBA), we are writing in 
favor of Bellevue adopting the 2021 IRC with amendments. MOBA’s mission is 
to promote and protect the home building industry. The principles of the IRC 
falls in line with MOBA’s desire to protect the public’s health, safety and 
welfare. 

Sincerely, 

Greg Frazell 

President, Metro Omaha Builders Association 

Chartered in 1946, MOBA’s mission is to promote and protect the home building industry. 





























 

 

 

 

 

 

 

         April 20, 2021 

 

1500 Wall Street  

Bellevue, Nebraska  

68005 

 

Re: Agenda Item 12g. 

The IAPMO Groups Supports City of Bellevue adopting 2021 UPC and USPSHTC 

 

Dear Bellevue City Council, 

 

On behalf of the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO) I am 

writing to share support for the City of Bellevue to adopt the 2021 Uniform Plumbing Code 

(UPC) and the 2021 Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa, and Hot Tub Code (USPSHTC). 

 

The Uniform Codes published by IAPMO are developed by an inclusive process that follows the 

requirements established by the American National Standards Institute. This process ensures 

industry expertise is at the heart of the codes, rather than special interests of a dominant group. 

These consensus-based model codes are the only plumbing and mechanical codes in the country 

to be designated as an American National Standard by ANSI, the industry’s gold standard for 

code development. 

 

The UPC and USPSHTC are developed by stakeholders who are completely committed to 

plumbing. The codes are developed by stakeholders who are completely committed to plumbing 

and mechanical systems. Each edition of the Uniform Codes aims to address the challenges 

facing the industry at that time and provide notable solutions that benefit all of society. This 

includes provisions to assist in drought prevention and preparation, water efficiency and 

sustainability, improved water quality, and overall affordability. 

 

IAPMO has recently published the 2021 UPC which contains better efficiency provisions, 

technological innovations, and up-to-date methods that could provide greater benefits for the 

residents of Bellevue, Nebraska. The UPC harmonizes with all building codes and is easier to 

enforce because there are fewer areas of field interpretation. This in turn helps eliminate conflict 

between contractors and inspectors that could lead to construction delays and cost overruns. 

 

The 2021 UPC has an Appendix known as the Peak Water Demand Calculator (WDC), which 

was scientifically vetted and can actually help generate cost-savings. For over 80 years we have 

been plumbing buildings using the same metrics for sizing pipes, but the WDC is a new tool that 

alters the ways in which we determine pipe sizing by accounting for flow rate and considering 

the probabilities of water use on premises. This tool decreases the amount of water being used in 

a system, which reduces energy costs and improves public health and safety. The WDC can be 

applied to single- and multi- family dwellings and depending on the size and number of fixtures 

within a dwelling unit, applying the Calculator’s provisions saves 10 – 15% in material and labor 

costs. 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

In addition, the 2021 UPC has an Appendix that addresses the growth of Legionella and 

waterborne pathogens. Legionella is a naturally occurring bacteria that thrives and grows quickly 

in hot water plumbing systems. A person can contract a serious pneumonia, called Legionnaires’ 

disease, when they breathe in water contaminated with Legionella that has become aerosolized or 

by accidentally inhaling this water directly into their airways while drinking. Legionnaires’ 

disease kills roughly 10% of the people who contract the disease overall. Recognizing the 

growing threat to public health, this section was added with the intent to further address 

waterborne diseases and related water quality issues that are increasing in frequency. 

 

Adoption of the 2021 UPC provides a pathway the City of Bellevue to utilize all supplemental 

appendices as needed. 

 

The USPSHTC is a stand-alone code which provides all necessary requirements for the 

installation, inspection and maintenance of swimming pool, spa, and hot tub systems and their 

component products. The code addresses disinfection, water quality requirements, and suction 

outlet entrapment protection methods. The USPSHTC contains ventilation and air quality 

requirements for indoor aquatic facilities and is written, revised, and updated on a regular basis 

by code specialists and experts in fields representing a variety of specialties –plumbing, 

engineering, electrical safety, construction, risk management, water quality, operations and 

maintenance.  Changes to the USPSHTC are made with a consensus of two-thirds majority 

by a diverse group of stakeholders and is used seamlessly by jurisdictions in conjunction with 

various building codes. 

 

It is also important to note that the UPC and USPSHTC are published utilizing IAPMO’s proven 

“turn-key” philosophy, placing as much of the necessary information concerning installations as 

possible in one code book each. This philosophy eliminates the problems and confusion caused 

by the use of multiple codes to install or inspect the plumbing or mechanical provisions of a 

single installation or system and integrates seamlessly with other model codes.  

 

In short, the UPC and USPSHTC are cutting edge codes that reflect true consensus from experts 

in the field, that enable resilient building in our changing world, and that can uphold the health 

and safety of residents in Bellevue. 

 

 

Sincerely, 

Brian Rogers 

Vice President 

Field Services 














































































































































































































































































	Agenda
	1. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
	2. INVOCATION - Pastor Joseph Gastineau, Revival Tabernacle Church, 2226 Jefferson Street.
	3. CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL
	4. OPEN MEETINGS ACT - Posted in the Entry to the Council Chambers
	5. APPROVAL OF AGENDA, CONSENT AGENDA, CLAIMS, AND ADVISORY COMMITTEE REPORTS:
	a. Approval of the Agenda
	b. Approval of the Consent Agenda (Items marked with an (*) are approved where this item is, unless otherwise removed)
	1. * Acknowledge Receipt of March 25, 2021 Planning Commission Minutes.
	5b1. March 25, 2021 Planning Commission Minutes

	2. * Acknowledge Receipt of March 31, 2021 Board of Health Minutes.
	5b2. BOH Minutes March 31, 2021

	3. * Approval of April 6, 2021 City Council Minutes.
	5b3. April 6, 2021 City Council Minutes

	4. *  Acknowledge Receipt of March 3, 2021 Sidewalk Task Force Minutes.
	5b4. Sidewalk Task Force Minutes March 3, 2021

	5. *  Acknowledge Receipt of March 9, 2021 Tree Board Meeting Minutes.
	5b5. March 9, 2021 Tree Board Minutes



	6. * APPROVAL OF CLAIMS.
	6a. Claims

	7. SPECIAL PRESENTATIONS:
	a. Proclamation declaring April 20, 2021 as "Arbor Day" in the City of Bellevue. (Councilman Preister)
	7a.Arbor Day Proclamation


	8. ORGANIZATIONAL MATTERS:
	a. *  Recommend reappointment of John Perrin and Leland Jacobson to the Citizens Complete Street Advisory Panel, for a four-year term ending April 2025 (Mayor)
	8a. Appointments to Citizens Complete Streets Advisory Panel


	9. APPROVED CITIZEN COMMUNICATION:  None Received
	10. LIQUOR LICENSES: None
	11. ORDINANCES FOR ADOPTION (3rd reading):
	a. Approve Ordinance No. 4029 to amend Article VI, Chapter 19 of the Bellevue Municipal Code by adding a new Section 19-83 regarding prohibition of engine braking.  (Public Works Director)
	11a. Ord. No. 4029 Regarding Prohibtion of engine braking


	12. ORDINANCES FOR PUBLIC HEARING (2nd reading):
	a. Ordinance No. 4036:  Request to rezone Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2, being a replat of Lots 15A, 15B, and 15C, Old Orchard Place, from AG and RE to RE and RG-50, for the purpose of existing residential development.  Applicant:  DWS Land Surveying.  General location:  9100 S 13th Street.  (Planning Manager)
	1. Approval of small subdivision plat Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2.  (No action taken at this meeting.)
	12a1. Small Subdivision Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2

	2. Approval of waiver of Section 6-7 (8) of the Subdivision Regulations for flag lots. (No action taken at this meeting.)
	12a. 12a1. and 12a2. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4036
	12a. 12a1. and 12a2. Staff Report Ord. No. 4036
	12a. Zoning Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2
	12a. GIS Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Place Replat 2
	12a. As Built
	12a. Small Subdivision Map Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2
	12a. Ord. No. 4036 Rezone Lots 1 through 3, Old Orchard Replat 2

	b. Ordinance No. 4030:  Amending Section 12-57 through 12-85, of the Municipal Code pertaining to Fireworks.  (City Clerk)
	12b. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4030
	12b. Ord. No. 4030 Fireworks - Clean Copy.docx
	12b. Red Line Amending Section 12-57 through 12-85

	c. Ordinance No. 4031: Ordinance pertaining to Adoption of the 2021 International Fire Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	12c. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4031
	12c. Ord. No. 4031 2021 International Fire Code

	d. Ordinance No. 4032: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International Building Code, International Residential Code and the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	12d. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4032
	12d. Ord. No. 4032 2021 Interntation Building Code
	12d. Council Letter for 4-20-21 Agenda
	12d. Letter - Mark Loscutoff

	e. Ordinance No. 4033: Ordinance pertaining to amendments of the 2021 International Residential Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	12e. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4033
	12e. Letter in support of 2021 IRC Adoption from Metro Omaha Builders Association
	12e. Ord. No. 4033 2021 International Residential Code

	f. Ordinance No. 4034: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 International Mechanical Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	12f. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4034
	12f. Ord. No. 4034 2021 International Mechancial Code

	g. Ordinance No. 4035: Ordinance pertaining to the adoption of the 2021 Uniform Plumbing Code; Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code and the 2021 International Fuel Gas Code.  (Chief Building Inspector)
	12g. Cover Sheet Ord. No. 4035
	12g. Ord. No. 4035 2021 Uniform Plumbing Code, Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tube and 2021 International Fuel Gas Code
	12g Brian Rogers - Support letter


	13. ORDINANCES FOR INTRODUCTION (1st reading):  None
	14. PUBLIC HEARING ON MATTERS OTHER THAN ORDINANCES:  None
	15. RESOLUTIONS:
	a. Resolution No. 2021-11:  A resolution ratifying all actions taken by the City Council during virtual meetings.  (Legal)
	15a. Res.  No. 2021-11 Ratifying all actions for virtual meetings


	16. CURRENT BUSINESS:
	a. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the CDBG-CV Round 3 Subrecipient Agreement with the Bellevue Public School Foundation for the COVID-19 PPE Emergency Assistance, in an amount not to exceed $8,904.00. (CDBG Program Specialist / Finance Director)
	16a. Cover Sheet Subrecipient BPS Foundation
	16a. Subrecipient Agreement BPS Foundation

	b. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the CDBG-CV Round 3 Subrecipient Agreement with All Communities Outreach Services for the COVID-19 Companionship and Outreach Assistance, in an amount not to exceed $29,907.00. (CDBG Program Specialist / Finance Director)
	16b. Cover Sheet Subrecipient Agreement with All Communities Outreach Services
	16b. Subrecipient Agreement All Communities Outreach Services

	c. Approve & authorize the Mayor to sign the agreement with DIY Holding Company, LLC for the 2021 Concrete Pavement Rehab Project, in an amount not to exceed $396,818.00, plus a 10% contingency of $39,681.80, for a total project cost of $436,499.80.  (Public Works Director)
	16c. DIY Holding for 2021 Concrete Payment Rehab Project

	d. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Professional Engineering Services Agreement with Jacobs Engineering Group Inc. for the seven sites in the Storm Drainage Improvement Project, in an amount not to exceed $241,757.00. (Public Works Director)
	16d. Jacobs Engineering Group Storm Drainage Improvement

	e. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Professional Services Agreement with Alfred Benesch & Company for the Municipal Separate Storm Sewer System (MS4) Annual Reporting, in an amount not to exceed $17,880.00. (Public Works Director)
	16e.  Professional Services Agreement - Benesch for MS4 annual reporting

	f. +++ Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Lease Agreement Addendum with the DMV located at 14402 Harlan Lewis Road, extending the terms for one year with an expiration date of April 30, 2022.  (City Administrator)
	16f. Lease Addendum with the DMV

	g. Recommendation to approve a Special Fireworks Application for Twisted Thunder Fireworks to provide a Special Fireworks Display for the Schankenberg wedding, at the View, 1102 Country Club Ct., on 05/21/21 at dusk for approximately 5 minutes.  (City Clerk)
	16g. Special Fireworks Display

	h. Approve and authorize the Mayor to sign the Purchase and Sale Agreement conveying 13407 Spencer Circle, which city acquired upon annexation, to Aimee and Brant Hill, in the amount of $32,000.00.  (Administration)
	16h. Purchase and Sale Agreement 13407 Spencer Circle


	17. ADMINISTRATION REPORTS: Comments must be limited to items on the current Reports (Monthly reports are given at the first Council Meeting of every month - April report will be attached to May 4th Council packet).
	18. CLOSED SESSION:
	19. ADJOURNMENT

