
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     

6-Jun-22

INSURANCE AGENCY

OSAG FY 2021-22    

Consolidated Benefits 

Resources, Beckham    

OSAG

OSIG FY 2021-22                       

A.J. GALLAGHER             

OSIG      

       OSAG 2022-23 

Consolidated Benefits 

Resources, Beckham Co.         

OSAG

  OSIG FY 2022-23            

A.J. Gallagher                       

OSIG                                                                                              

TOTAL PREMIUM TOTAL PREMIUM TOTAL PREMIUM TOTAL PREMIUM

COVERAGE

Property and Casulty no bid $95,063.00 no bid $165,234.00

Boiler and Machines no bid $524.00 no bid $996.00

General Liability no bid $5,614.00 no bid $6,161.00

School Board Legal Liability no bid $5,614.00 no bid $6,161.00

Automobile Liability no bid $7,483.00 no bid $8,216.00

Automobile Physical no bid $4,333.00 no bid $5,792.00

Excess Liability no bid $1,648.00 no bid $1,843.00

Student Med Liability (estimate based on 

previous year enrollment) no bid included no bid Included

Garage Keepers & Garage Liability no bid included no bid Included

Employee Benefit Liability no bid included no bid Included

Earth Quake Coverage no bid included no bid Included

Terrorism no bid included no bid Included

Total Property and Casulty no bid $120,279.00 no bid $194,403.00

Workers Compensation $34,707.00 no bid $36,506.00 No Bid

2021-22 Total Annual Premium 2022-23 Total Annual Premium

$154,986.00 $230,909.00

OSIG = Oklahoma School Insurance Group Signature

OSAG=Oklahoma School Assurance Group
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