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INSURANCE AGENCY

OSAG FY 2025-26
Consolidated Benefits 

Resources, Beckham   

OSAG

OSIG FY 2025-26
A.J. GALLAGHER  

OSIG      

OSAG 2026-27
Consolidated Benefits 

Resources, Beckham Co. 

OSAG

OSIG FY 2026-27 
A.J. Gallagher 

OSIG 

TOTAL PREMIUM TOTAL PREMIUM TOTAL PREMIUM TOTAL PREMIUM

COVERAGE

Property and Casulty no bid $296,099.00 no bid $294,510.00

Boiler and Machines no bid $1,404.00 no bid $1,203.00

General Liability no bid $6,554.00 no bid $8,204.00

School Board Legal Liability no bid $6,554.00 no bid $8,204.00

Automobile Liability no bid $8,739.00 no bid $10,939.00

Automobile Physical no bid $8,163.00 no bid $7,682.00

Excess Liability no bid $4,373.00 no bid $2,995.00

Student Med Liability (estimate based on 

previous year enrollment) no bid included no bid Included

Garage Keepers & Garage Liability no bid included no bid Included

Employee Benefit Liability no bid included no bid Included

Earth Quake Coverage no bid included no bid Included

Terrorism no bid included no bid Included

Total Property and Casulty no bid $331,886.00 no bid $333,737.00

Workers Compensation $42,832.00 no bid $36,847.00 No Bid

2025-26 Total Annual

Premium$374,718.00

2026-27 Total Annual 

Premium$370,854.00

OSIG = Oklahoma School Insurance Group Signature

OSAG=Oklahoma School Assurance Group
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